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       RECAP
Bid #118-11
DUE DATE: 3-3-2011

01 TABLE
   LIBRARY

MEDIATECHNOLOGIES 
METRO SERIES
(School Specialty #6

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

669.00
No bid
668.32
No bid
626.25
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

626.25

02 ACTIVITY TABLE
     KIDNEY

ALLIED
(Highsmith #H52127R)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
447.31
No bid
455.89
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Highsmith 447.31

03 CHAIR
    SOLID WOOD

MEDIATECHNOLOGIES 
BENCHMARK SERIES  
“SLAT BACK”  (School 

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

163.00
No bid
167.12
No bid
162.61
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

162.61

04 STUDENT CHAIR

VIRCO MARTEST 21 3000 
Series #3014

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

71.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 71.00

    * Does Not Meet Specifications     ** No Specificiations Provided     *** Not FOB:  Soldotna
                                                                                ****Draw
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05 STOOL

VIRCO 3000 Series 
#3860GCLS

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

244.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
123.05*
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 244.00

06 STOOL

ARTCO-BELL “UNIFLEX” 
#0803

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
82.45
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

82.45

07 OFFICE CHAIR

TRUE INNOVATIONS  #9636
(Office Depot #301437)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

204.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

No Award

08 STUDENT DESK

VIRCO 7900 Series 
#792026BB

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

158.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
143.75
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctice Office 158.00
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09 STUDENT DESK

SCHOLARCRAFT 2900 
Series

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

108.00
No bid
151.08
No bid
97.93
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

97.93

10 COMPUTER DESK

LORELL “RADIUS”  
#LLR44311

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

375.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 375.00

11 SIT TO STAND 
WORKSTATION
        WITH TWO 
DETACHABLE WORK 
SURFACES

THE KANGAROO PRO

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

12 PRINTER STAND

LORELL  #LLR44312

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

165.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 165.00
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13 MODULAR DESK
              EXECUTIVE

UPTOWN MODULAR 
SERIES BOW-FRONT
K-Log #UMO-ED

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

355.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
424.41
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 355.00

14 DESK RETURN
              EXECUTIVE

UPTOWN MODULAR 
SERIES BOW-FRONT
K-Log #UMO-EDR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

175.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
245.11
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 175.00

15 COMPUTER CREDENZA

UPTOWN MODULAR 
SERIES
K-Log #UMO-CR

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

690.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
290.35
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 690.00

16 COMPUTER CREDENZA 
HUTCH

UPTOWN MODULAR 
SERIES
K-Log #UMO-CRH

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

300.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
391.99
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 300.00
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17 BOX/BOX/FILE PEDESTAL
        MOBILE

UPTOWN MODULAR 
SERIES
K-Log #UMO-BBF

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

210.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
170.51
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 210.00

18 KEYBOARD DRAWER
      DROP-DOWN

UPTOWN MODULAR 
SERIES
K-Log #UMO-EDKD

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

120.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
60.10
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 120.00

19 CUBBIES STORAGE UNIT

Lakeshore #JJ679

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
No bid
560.92
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Lakeshore 
Learning

560.92

20 DEEP SHELF STORAGE 
UNIT

School Specialty #1335361

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
138.01
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

138.01
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21 STORAGE TRAY

School Specialty #279052

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
2.69
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

2.69

22 COAT LOCKER

BIRD-IN-HAND
(School Specialty #271666)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
123.69
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

123.69

23 READING / WRITING 
CENTER

REGAL
(School Specialty #1300060)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

569.00
831.72
295.83
No bid
448.89
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Highsmith 295.83

24 BOOKCASE

CLASSROOM SELECT
(School Specialty #1363511)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

155.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
234.41
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Arctic Office 155.00
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25 BOOKCASE
        MOBILE

BIRD-IN-HAND #1291238
(School Specialty #1291238)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

975.00
No bid
No bid
No bid
173.47
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

173.47

26 CART
    FLAT PANEL

BUHL
(Brodart #87-659-001)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

No bid
551.00
463.17
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Highsmith 463.17

27 CART
    PULL-OUT LAPTOP 
SHELF

LUXOR
(Brodart #85-398-003)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

320.00
318.86
131.25
No bid
173.77
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Highsmith 131.25

28 MARKERBOARD
     PORCELAIN STEEL

BEST-RITE
(Brodart #80-856-001)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

545.00
1036.71
341.26
No bid
392.87
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

Highsmith 341.26
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29 MARKERBOARD
     PORCELAIN STEEL

BEST-RITE
(Dallas Midwest #B20836)

Size -

Brand
Bid -

Arctic Office
Brodart
Highsmith
Lakeshore Learning
School Specialty
AA-K Business Environments
Nasco
Spectrum Industries
Demco

850.00
No bid
524.25
No bid
492.24
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid

School 
Specialty

492.24


