
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #104-20 Recap - Technology Equipment

Award is in bold

MVATION

CDW-G GCSIT Hypertec USA Worldwide Inc. OfficeDepot Staples

Dell Latitude 5400 $1,250.00 $889.00 $992.20 $1,262.42 NO BID NO BID

XCTO Laptop

Dell Latitude 3300 $830.00 $569.00 $565.98 - alt $784.53 NO BID NO BID

128GB Drive XCTO Laptop

Dell Latitude 3300 $830.00 $605.00 $734.32 $784.53 NO BID NO BID

256GB Drive XCTO Laptop

Dell Optiplex 5070 $800.00 $617.00 $700.81 $847.17 NO BID NO BID

SFF XCTO Desktop

Dell Chromebook 11 $275.00 NO BID $280.21 $286.69 NO BID  NO BID

3100  - Touch

Dell PowerEdge T640 $5,400.00 $5,461.00 $6,179.68 $5,710.36 NO BID NO BID

Server

Dell VSAN Ready Node $21,000.00 $17309.00 Alt $19852.10 Alt $20078.28 Alt NO BID NO BID

R740XD Server

Vmware Virtual SAN $4,656.47 NO BID $4,620.64 $4,675.00 NO BID NO BID

Licensing & Support

Google Chrome OS $31.94 NO BID $24.26 $30.00 NO BID NO BID

Management Console License,

Education

Charging Cart $1,250.00 NO BID $1,352.14 $1,354.86 Alt. NO BID NO BID

36-Bay

Charging Cart $554.09 NO BID $665.92 $666.66 Alt. NO BID NO BID

16-Bay

Dell Business Dock $200.00 $174.00 $226.78 $188.69 NO BID NO BID

WD19 90 PD

LG Portable DVD+/-RW $58.00 NO BID $55.94 $36.88 Alt. NO BID NO BID

External Drive 


