
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District

Bid #102-21 Recap - Toner & Ink Cartridges (REVISED)

Award is in bold
Access Products The Office School CVR Computer GCS Imaging, Lewis & SCW

Inc. Pal Specialty Supplies Inc. Lewis

010310 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black $34.00 $32.99 $49.22 $32.00 NO BID $33.18 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD #F6U64AN#140  

010311 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Tri-Color $35.00 $34.30 $51.55 $34.00 NO BID $34.51 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD # F6U63AN#140  

010312 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black $40.00 NO BID $55.22 $39.00 NO BID $39.03 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD #F6U19AN#140 

010313 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Cyan $30.00 NO BID $41.22 $30.00 NO BID $29.60 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S61AN#140 

010314 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Yellow $30.00 NO BID $39.55 $33.00 NO BID $29.61 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S67AN#140 

010315 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Magenta $30.00 NO BID $39.22 $33.00 NO BID $29.61 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S64AN#140 

010316 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black $29.00 NO BID $41.99 $29.00 NO BID $28.71 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD #C2P23AN#140 

010320 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black $31.00 NO BID $41.99 $30.00 NO BID $30.29 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CN053AN#140 

010321 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Cyan $17.00 NO BID $24.28 $30.00 NO BID $16.12 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CN054AN#140 

010322 INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Magenta $17.00 NO BID $24.28 $32.00 NO BID $16.12 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CN055AN#140 



Access Products The Office School CVR Computer GCS Imaging, Lewis & SCW

Inc. Pal Specialty Supplies Inc. Lewis

010342 INK CARTRIDGE, STANDARD SIZE Black $45.00 $40.85 $62.55 $46.00 NO BID $44.24 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD C8767WN#140 

010343 INK CARTRIDGE, STANDARD SIZE Tri-Color $51.00 $45.76 $65.55 $52.00 NO BID $50.63 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD C9363WN#140 

010702 TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, BLACK $148.00 NO BID $199.55 $160.00 $182.00 $127.85 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CE390A 

010703 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK $152.00 $130.00 $199.99 $162.00 $185.00 $124.26 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CF280X 

010704 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK $169.00 $135.00 $265.55 $177.00 $205.00 $141.02 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CF226X 

010718 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK $140.00 $130.00 $199.55 $144.00 $172.00 $114.66 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CE505X 

010721 TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, BLACK $148.00 NO BID $199.99 $153.00 $183.00 $128.38 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CC364A 

010733 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK $81.00 NO BID $133.22 $86.00 $90.00 $70.45 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CF230X 

010746 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK $184.00 $171.08 $288.22 $190.00 $220.00 $157.34 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CF360X 

010749 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, MAGENTA $254.00 $231.57 $399.22 $266.00 $310.00 $216.88 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CF363X 

010750 TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK $89.00 $80.00 $122.55 $86.00 $104.00 $74.18 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CE410X 



Access Products The Office School CVR Computer GCS Imaging, Lewis & SCW

Inc. Pal Specialty Supplies Inc. Lewis

010751 TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, YELLOW $103.00 $105.00 $141.22 $99.00 $120.00 $85.80 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CE412A 

010752 TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, MAGENTA $103.00 $105.00 $141.22 $100.00 $120.00 $85.80 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CE413A 

010753 TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, CYAN $103.00 $105.00 $141.22 $100.00 $120.00 $85.80 NO BID

HEWLETT PACKARD CE411A 


