
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT 

BID RECAP 

 

ITB #103-21 Diesel Fuel 

 
Award in BOLD 

 

 
DIESEL FUEL 

 
 CROWLEY  HOME RUN DELTA WESTERN/ PETRO MARINE SHORESIDE SUBURBAN 

  OIL CO. INC. DBA INLET ENERGY SERVICES & PETROLEUM, INC. PROPANE 

    ALASKA OIL SALES 

 

Fireweed Academy No Bid $1.7235 No Bid $1.4599 No Bid No Bid 

 

McNeil Canyon Elementary No Bid $1.6235 No Bid $1.4499 No Bid No Bid 

 

Seward Elementary School $1.5635 No Bid $1.4148 No Bid $1.3599 No Bid 

  

Seward High School $1.5635 No Bid $1.4048 No Bid $1.3599 No Bid 

   

Seward Middle School $1.5635 No Bid $1.4148 No Bid $1.3599 No Bid 

 

Voznesenka School No Bid $1.7235 No Bid $1.4599 No Bid No Bid 
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