Dell Latitude 5420 - Only
XCTO Laptop Computer
14" FHD Touch Screen
Dell Latitude 3310 - Only
XCTO Laptop Computer
13.3" FHD Touch Screen

Dell OptiPlex 5080 - Only
SFF XCTO Desktop Computer

Dell Chromebook 3100 - Only
11.6" HD Touch Screen

Google Chrome Education - Only

Anywhere Cart AC-CDW-36

Anywhere Cart AC-MINI-16

Dell Business Dock - Only

WD19 130w Power Delivery

* = Alternate

** = Does Not Meet Specifications

Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #108-21 - Technology
Award is in bold

CcDW

$1,525.00

$825.00

$700.00

$228.00**

$31.00

$900.00

$550.00

$250.00

Dell

NO BID

$897.02

$718.74

$240.37

$32.07

$1,137.77

$628.42**

$258.99

GCSIT
Solutions

$896.00

$551.00

$585.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$214.00

Hypertec
USA, Inc.

$1,230.84

$713.88

§774.55

$254.25

$30.41

$1,565.57

$640.29

$208.98

Ricoh USA

$1,533.00

$877.00

$872.00

$315.00

$33.00

$2,039.00

$695.00

$284.00

Staples

$1,506.70

$819.05

$800.90

$269.56

$30.47
$920.90*
$645.61*

$264.72



