KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Frozen Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #111-21
= PACK PRICE PER | PRICE PER
E QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR UNIT FOB UNIT FOB
+ SOLDOTNA | ANCHORAGE
Hamburger Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Baked, Baker Boy #31014 US FOODS $37.88 $37.01
Sliced. One bun must provide 2 oz equivalent or approved equal
200 | 600 lcasel 1201 grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
oz Requirements.
Hoagie Rolls, 5", Whole Grain, Hinge Sliced. Oven Fresh #62852
Each roll must provide 2.25 oz equivalent grains or approved equal US FOODS $53.39 Alt 50 58 Alt
2011 40 lcasel 72123 to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
002 Requirements. NO AWARD
Biscuit Sticks, Frozen. One serving must provide [Rich's #16317 US FOODS $30.69 $29.65
1 0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition or approved equal
Meal Pattern Requirements.
202 | 120 |CASE|250/1.2507
English Muffin, Sliced, 3.5", Whole Grain White. |Bake Crafters #802 US FOODS $41.59 $40.63
One serving must provide 2 0z equivalent grains or approved equal
203 | 60 lcasel 1aam to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
oz Requirements.
Mini Garlic Toast, 51% Whole Grain, Brown &  (Baker Boy #20550 US FOODS $37.17 $36.48
Serve. One piece must provide 1 0z equivalent or approved equal
204 | 80 lcasel 19601 grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
oz Requirements.
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S Bread, White, Gluten-Free, Frozen, Loaf, Sliced. |Rotella's #30001
or approved equal US FOODS $50.34 Alt $49.84 Alt
205 5 |CASE[12 Loaves
Flour Tortilla, Heat Pressed, 10" Mission #10420 US FOODS $37.06 $35.86
or approved equal NO AWARD
206 | 15 |CASE| 12/12ct
Flour Tortilla, Heat Pressed, 4.5" Mission #28671 US FOODS $29.40 $28.50
or approved equal NO AWARD
207 | 10 |CASE| 24/12ct
Hot Dog Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Fully Baked  |Baker Boy #31034 US FOODS $42.03 $41.28
and Sliced. or approved equal
208 | 50 |CASE| 144 ct
Beef Hot Dogs, 6", CN Labeled. Product Must  [Farmland #7024781096 US FOODS $30.68 $30.16
Provide 2.00 oz meat/meat alternate to meet or approved equal
209 | 90 leasel soe Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
t IMade With 100% USDA inspected cuts of Beef
with no fillers or extenders.
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Whole Grain Breaded Beef Finger, Fully Cooked |Advance Pierre #69009 US FOODS NO BID NO BID
Beef Steak, CN labeled. One Serving must Advance Pierre #68016
210 | 160 lcasel 500797 provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 1 oz
97024 quivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal ~ [OF @PProved equal
Pattern Requirements.
Beef, Teriyaki Nugget, Fully Cooked, CN Advance Pierre #3827 US FOODS NO BID NO BID
Labeled. One Serving must provide 2 oz or approved equal
211 | 200 lcaseltoons meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal
© 02| pattern Requirements.
Beef, Philly Steak Strips, Fully Cooked, Steak | Tyson #10000097565 US FOODS NO BID NO BID
Eze Redi Steak or approved equal
212 | 30 |CASE| 10#
Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, Tyson 70302-928 US FOODS $110.19 $108.52
Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. One patty must or approved equal
23| 80 lcaselisoszs provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz
1907 equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, Tyson 2154-928 US FOODS $69.31 $67.69
Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. One patty must or approved equal
24| 80 |caseltsos.2 provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz
2907 equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
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Chicken, Breaded Strips, 51% Whole Grain Tyson #703322-928 US FOODS $120.16 $118.48
Breaded, Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. One or approved equal
215 | 20 |casel 11045 serving must provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate
02 [and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Corn Pup Dogs, Chicken, Whole Grain, CN Foster Farms #96086 US FOODS $28.22 $27.67
Labeled. One serving must provide 2 0z or approved equal
216 | 500 lcasel  1o# meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains
to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
BBQ Pork Rib Patty, Fully Cooked with BBQ  |Advance Pierre #3817 US FOODS $54.39 $53.32
Sauce, CN Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz or approved equal
217 | 160 lcaseloos.os meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal
299 pattern Requirements.
Grilled Cheese Sandwich, Whole Grain, Integrated #134000 US FOODS $67.24 $66.07
'\R/Ieduced”Solc\ill\t/Jn(13 QTegc?ndCQeedse f(M t or approved equal
ozzarella, IW, abeled. Product Mus
218 | 200 |CASE| 72/4.190z Provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
Sandwich, Grape Jelly & Soy Spread, Whole | Albie's #607 US FOODS $51.66 $51.04
Grain, Crustless, Nut Free. Product mulst provide or approved equal
29| 30 |case| 72124 1 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz equivalent
492 14rains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
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S Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat, Reduced  |Campbell's #26789
Sodium, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. Product 1) o4 5| akes #43274 US FOODS $76.58 $74.95
220 | 100 lcasel e must provide 2.00 oz meat/meat alternate and 1
0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal |27 @PProved equal
Pattern Requirements.
Enchilada Empanada, Chicken & Cheese, Albie's #3860 US FOODS $50.50 $49.70
Whole Grain, Bulk Pack. Product must provide 2 or approved equal
0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent
221 80 |CASE| 48f50z grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
Burrito, Southwestern Style Black Bean & MCI #71673 US FOODS $78.37 $76.73
Cheese, IW, WG, CN Labeled. One burrito must or approved equal
02 | 80 lcasel so provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz
0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
Taco Snack, Beef, WG, Bulk Pack, CN Labeled. [Fernando's #5211 US FOODS $50.68 $49.65
Product must provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate or approved equal
293 | 200 lcasel 605 and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child
92 |Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Quesadilla, Chicken & Cheese, WG, Pre-cut, CN[Schwan's #78373 US FOODS $85.70 $84.30
Labeled. Product must'prowde 2 pz meat/meat or approved equal
24| 70 lcasel os/aa alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet
“#0Z 1Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
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Pizza, Tony's 4x6 Cheese Pizza, Whole Grain, |Tony's #78697 US FOODS $56.03 $54.53
CN Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz or approved equal
295 | 25 |casel o645 meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains
992 16 meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
Pizza, Big Daddy's, 16" Cheese Pizza, Whole  |Schwan's #78637 US FOODS $82.72 $81.41
Grain, CN Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz or approved equal
meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains
226 | 30 |CASE|72/5.180z to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
Pizza, Breakfast Pizza, 51% Whole Grain, Tony's #63912 US FOODS $60.17 $58.66
Turkey Sausage, CN Labeled. Product must or approved equal
297 | 60 |caseltzsa st provide 1 0z meat/meat alternate and 1.5 oz
2107 equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
French Bread Multi-Cheese Garlic, 6", Whole  |[Schwan's #68724 US FOODS $60.52 $59.62
Grain, ?/N La:)ell:ed. Otne szr\élng muslt p[owtde 2 or approved equal
0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalen
228 | 30 |CASE| 60/4.290z grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
Breaded Mozzarella Cheese Sticks, Reduced  [Rich's #65219 US FOODS $67.71 $66.44
Sodium, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. 5 Sticks or approved equal
29 | 20 lcase| s must provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
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The Max Mozzarella Cheese Filled Breadsticks, |Conagra #7738712602 US FOODS $76.13 $74.87
51% Whole Grain, CN Labeled. One stick must or approved equal
230 | 30 leasel 19210 provide 1 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz
0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
Spaghetti, Short-Cut, Whole Grain, 60 Second  |Marzetti #41308-31002 US FOODS $33.14 $32.09
prep time or approved equal
231 | 120 |CASE| 20#
Rotini Pasta, Tri-Color, Frozen, Pre-Cooked.  |Marzetti #41308-26007 US FOODS $31.19 $30.24
or approved equal
232 | 20 |CASE| 6/3#
Whole Grain Maple Glazed French Toast Sticks, |Michael Foods 46025-75010-00  (US FOODS $45.91 $45.01
Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. Each 2.9 oz serving or approved equal
233 | 150 |casel 529 must provide 1 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz
00z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
Sausage Patty 3", Fully Cooked Pork Sausage |JTM #5674CE US FOODS NO BID NO BID
Patties, CN Labeled. Each 1.33 0z Cooked Pork or approved equal
234 CASE|360/1 Sausage Patty must provide 1 0z meat/meat
3 30 360/1.3302 alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
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Egg Patty, Grilled, Lightly Browned Round Sunny Fresh #40710 US FOODS $65.49 $63.98
Scrambled Egg Patty, CN Labeled. Each 1.250z or approved equal
235 | 15 |caselsser 25 Egg Patty Provides 1 0z meat/meat alternate to
2992 meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Breadsticks with Apple Filling, Whole Grain. Albie's #711 US FOODS $38.42 $37.58
Product must provide 2 0z equivalent grains to or approved equal
236 | 50 lcasel 7213502 meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Pillsbury Pancakes, Mini, Strawberry Flavor, |General Mills #137731000 US FOODS $36.64 $35.72
Whole Grain, Individually Wrapped, CN Labeled. or approved equal
237 | 120 |casel 721317 Product Must Provide 2 oz equivalent grains to
1192 meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Super Slice Banana Bread, IW, 51% Whole Super Bakery #6071 US FOODS $47.66 $46.86
Grain, Peanut Free, CN Labeled. Product must or approved equal
238 | 200 lcasel 7034 provide 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child
A0Z Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Muffin, Blueberry, 51% Whole Grain, Product  |Otis Spunkmeyer #10143 US FOODS $36.90 $36.36
must provide 1 0z equivalent grains to meet or approved equal
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
239 | 200 |CASE| 72/20z
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Banana Chocolate Chunk Benefit Bar. Product [J&J Snackfoods #40402 US FOODS $30.12 $29.67
must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to meet or approved equal
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
240 | 200 |CASE| 48/2.50z
Super Bakery Baked Cinnamon Bun, Whole Super Bakery #6070 US FOODS $39.88 $39.15
Grain. Product must provide 2 0z equivalent or approved equal
o1 | 100 lcasel 72129 grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
~J0Z Requirements
Dutch Waffle, 5", 51% Whole Grain, CN J&J Snackfoods #4521 US FOODS $28.60 $28.13
Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz equivalent or approved equal
a2 | 80 lcasel g5 grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
Requirements.
Cookie, Chocolate Chip, 51% Whole Grain. Otis Spunkmeyer #55680 US FOODS $59.60 $58.40
or approved equal
243 | 60 |CASE|240/1.50z
Crinkle Cut Fries, Seasoned, Crispy, 1/2" Deep [Mccain #1000007470 US FOODS $44.64 $43.06
Groove, Low Sodium or approved equal
244 | 200 |CASE| 6/5#
Valid: July 1, 2021 --> April 30, 2022 9



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Frozen Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #111-21
= PACK PRICE PER | PRICE PER
E QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR UNIT FOB UNIT FOB
+ SOLDOTNA | ANCHORAGE
Hash Brown Rounds, Coin-shaped hash browns, [Mccain #1000006188 US FOODS $48.38 $46.80
Low Sodium. or approved equal
245 | 160 |CASE| 6/5#
Fried Rice, Whole Grain, Frozen, Made with Minh #69074 US FOODS $66.52 $64.90
zrc?wn rice, cgrrots, peas, corn and authentic or approved equal
sian seasonings.
246 | 140 |CASE| 84/5.902 J
Broccoli Cuts, Frozen, IQF. Simplot #30586 US FOODS $35.25 $33.97
Signature
247 | 60 |CASE| 12/2# or approved equal
Vegetable, Monterey Blend, Frozen Mix of Simplot #10071179016304 US FOODS $43.72 $42.44
Broccoli, Cauliflower, Carrots and Yellow Carrots or approved equal
248 | 80 |CASE| 8/3#
Cheese, Yellow American, Sliced, 50% Reduced |Land O Lakes #46288 US FOODS $103.75 $102.19
Fat, 50% Reduced Sgdlum, Pastegrlzed or approved equal
249 5 |case 54 Processed. One serving must provide 1 0z
8 6/5 meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal
Pattern Requirements.
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Cheese, Mozzarella, Sliced Schreiber #11752
or approved equal US FOODS $36.18 Alt $35.70 Alt
250 | 10 |CASE| 6/1.5#
Cheese, Mozzarella, Shredded, 5# bag. Land O Lakes #41698 US FOODS $61.67 $60.60
or approved equal
251 20 |CASE| 4/5#
Cheese, Cheddar, Shredded, 5# bag Land O Lakes #41749 US FOODS $64.92 $63.84
or approved equal
252 | 20 |CASE| 4/5#
Parmesan Cheese, Shredded, 5# bag. Della Vita #41880 US FOODS $99.66 $98.58
or approved equal
253 5 |CASE| 4/5#
Parmesan Cheese, Grated Kraft/Heinz #10021000615688
or approved equal US FOODS $99.54 Alt. $98.49 Alt
254 | 20 |CASE| 1/5# NO AWARD
Valid: July 1, 2021 --> April 30, 2022 11
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String Cheese, Individually Wrapped, 10z Per  |Land O Lakes #59703 US FOODS $42.28 $41.70
Serving or approved equal

255 | 30 |CASE| 168/10z
Butter, Unsalted, 1# Blocks Columbia Valley #06327

Glenview Farms #4268644

256 | 4 |CASE| 30/1# or approved equal US FOODS $84.18 Alt $82.51 Alt
Bacon, Pre-cooked slices, 100% real bacon, Hormel #03729 US FOODS $45.12 $44.93
warm & serve. or approved equal

257 | 30 |CASE|300 Slices
Pepperoni, Sliced, Vac Pack, About 16 slices  |Hormel #32048 US FOODS $39.96 $39.42
per ounce. or approved equal

258 | 25 |CASE| 2/5#
Triple Berry Blend, IQF, Frozen mix of Simplot #10071179016311 US FOODS $60.19 $58.62
2tra;vb:(;geez, blackberries and blueberries, No or approved equal

ugar .
259 | 30 |case| st [T
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Juice, Apple, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 oz liquid,  [Sig #62678 US FOODS $36.95 $35.50
o 1
100% Juice Ardmore #41381
260 | 500 |CASE| 96/40z Johanna Peterkin $25.92 NO BID
or approved equal
Juice, Orange, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 oz liquid, [Sig #62681 US FOODS $38.34 $36.89
100% Juice. Ardmore #41380
261 [ 60 |CASE| 96/40z Johanna Peterkin $24.96 NO BID
or approved equal
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