Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #101-22 Recap - Toner & Ink Cartridges
Award is in bold

010310

010311

010312

010313

010314

010315

010316

010317

010318

010319

010320

010321

010322

010323

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black
HEWLETT PACKARD #F6U64AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Tri-Color
HEWLETT PACKARD # F6U63AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black
HEWLETT PACKARD #F6U19AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Cyan
HEWLETT PACKARD #LOS61AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Yellow
HEWLETT PACKARD #L0S67AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Magenta
HEWLETT PACKARD #LOS64AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black
HEWLETT PACKARD #3YL65AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Magenta
HEWLETT PACKARD #3YL63AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Yellow
HEWLETT PACKARD #3YL64AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Cyan
HEWLETT PACKARD #3YL62AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Black
HEWLETT PACKARD CNO53AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Cyan
HEWLETT PACKARD CNO54AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Magenta
HEWLETT PACKARD CNO55AN#140

INK CARTRIDGE, HIGH YIELD Yellow
HEWLETT PACKARD CNO56AN#140

Access
Products, Inc.

$34.00*

$35.00*

$40.00*

$30.50*

$30.50*

$30.50*

$34.50*

$34.50*

$34.50*

$34.50*

$31.00*

$17.00*

$17.00*

$17.00*

Amalgamated
Services, Inc.

$49.86
$18.63
Alt.

$15.69
Alt.

$12.75
Alt.

$12.75
Alt.

$12.75
Alt.

$51.11

$28.61

$28.61

$28.61

$11.50

Alt.

$10.31
Alt.

$10.31
Alt.

$10.31
Alt.

Arctic Office
Products

$35.368

$37.130

$41.590

$31.844

$31.844

$31.844

$36.260

$20.338

$20.338

$20.338

$32.391

$17.383

$17.383

$17.372

CDWG

$38.00

$40.00

$33.00

$33.00

$33.00

$45.00

$39.00

$21.00

$21.00

$21.00

$35.00

$19.00

$19.00

$19.00

Fulltek
Wholesale, Inc.

$39.00

$40.00

$45.00

$35.00

$35.00

$35.00

$38.00

$22.00

$22.00

$22.00

$36.00

$19.00

$19.00

$19.00

Insight Public
Sector, Inc.

$35.00*

$37.00*

$42.00*

$32.00*

$32.00*

$32.00*

$36.00*

$21.00*

$21.00*

$21.00*

$32.00*

$17.00*

$17.00*

$17.00*

Lewis & Lewis

$33.45

$34.26

$38.70

$29.40

$29.40

$29.40

$34.09

$19.20

$19.20

$19.20

$30.63

$16.32

$16.32

$16.32

Office Depot

$33.91

$35.61

$39.86

$30.51

$30.51

$30.51

$40.89

$22.89

$22.89

$22.89

$36.39

$16.46

$16.46

$16.46

The Office
Pal

$31.32

$32.55

$38.72

$29.37

$29.37

$29.37

$33.78

$18.76

$18.76

$18.76

$30.07

$15.90

$15.90

$15.90

Pitney
Bowes

$36.00

$37.00

$42.00

$32.75

$32.75

$32.75

$40.00

$22.50

$22.50

$22.50

$35.00

$18.50

$18.50

$18.50

School
Specialty, LLC

$46.50

$48.59

$53.10

$39.34

$39.34

$39.34

$45.59

$25.59

$25.59

$25.59

$39.63

$20.95

$20.95

$20.95

Best Buy

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



010704

010718

010721

010733

010746

010747

010748

010749

010750

010751

010752

010753

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK
HEWLETT PACKARD CF226X

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK
HEWLETT PACKARD CE505X

TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, BLACK
HEWLETT PACKARD CC364A

TONER, LASERIJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK
HEWLETT PACKARD CF230X

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK
HEWLETT PACKARD CF360X

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, CYAN
HEWLETT PACKARD CF361X

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, YELLOW
HEWLETT PACKARD CF362X

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, MAGENTA
HEWLETT PACKARD CF363X

TONER, LASERJET, HIGH YIELD, BLACK
HEWLETT PACKARD CE410X

TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, YELLOW
HEWLETT PACKARD CE412A

TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, MAGENTA
HEWLETT PACKARD CE413A

TONER, LASERJET, STANDARD SIZE, CYAN
HEWLETT PACKARD CE411A

* = NOT FOB SOLDOTNA

$170.00*

$141.00*

$148.00*

$81.00*

$184.00*

$254.00*

$254.00*

$254.00*

$89.00*

$104.00*

$104.00*

$104.00*

$138.59

Alt.

$47.50

Alt.

$130.33

Alt.

$47.55

Alt.

$88.31

Alt.

$84.38

Alt.

$93.75

Alt.

$93.75

Alt.

$47.50

Alt.

$45.63

Alt.

$45.63

Alt.

$45.63

Alt.

$185.313

$153.680

$163.760

$87.606

$202.573

$280.055

$280.055

$280.055

$97.351

$112.782

$112.782

$112.782

$205.00

$170.00

$170.00

$95.00

$220.00

$290.00

$290.00

$290.00

$100.00

$120.00

$120.00

$120.00

$215.00

$180.00

$193.00

$97.00

$230.00

$315.00

$320.00

$315.00

$110.00

$125.00

$125.00

$125.00

$184.00*

$152.00*

$161.00*

$87.00*

$199.00*

$277.00*

$277.00*

$277.00*

$96.00*

$111.00*

$111.00*

$111.00*

$143.11

$116.16

$127.27

$68.98

$158.82

$219.24

$219.24

$219.24

$75.71

$87.10

$87.10

$87.10

$169.46

$141.83

$158.08

$85.76

$203.34

$281.02

$281.02

$281.02

$99.85

$113.73

$113.73

$113.73

$166.99

$139.99

$155.00

$82.27

$190.09

$263.15

$263.15

$263.15

$90.99

$95.00

$95.00

$95.00

$182.00

$137.00

$160.00

$88.00

$199.00

$277.00

$277.00

$277.00

$96.00

$111.00

$111.00

$111.00

$240.71

$179.26

$190.96

$108.93

$275.56

$385.53

$385.53

$385.53

$116.64

$133.71

$134.00

$133.94

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



