
 

   Kenai Peninsula Borough School District          

  Bid #113-22 Recap - Technology Equipment         

  Award is in bold             

                 

        Dell  GCSIT   Office    Tommy 

      Best Buy  

 

Technology  Solutions  Depot  Staples  TQL LLD 

                 

Dell Latitude 5420 XCTO Base (only)  No Bid  $1,300.00   $889.00   No Bid  $1,532.95   $1,670.00  

(210-AYNM)                

                 

Dell Latitude 3310 XCTO (only)   No Bid  $895.00   $551.00   No Bid  $890.26   $990.00  

(210-AVKC)                

                  

Dell OptiPlex 5090 SFF XCTO (only)  No Bid  $880.00   $585.00   No Bid  $951.22   $1,000.00  

(210-AYSC)                

                 

Dell Chromebook 3110 (only)    No Bid  $240.00 *  No Bid  No Bid  $435.97   $450.00  

(210-BCGK)       $370.19 *         

                 
GOOGLE CHROME OS EDU PERPETUAL 

LICENSE No Bid  $33.00   No Bid  No Bid  $30.99   $30.00  

Chrome Education                

(CROS-SW-DIS-EDU-NEW)               

                 



Charging Cart     No Bid  $950.00   No Bid  No Bid  $901.58   $950.00  

Anywhere Cart AC-30                

                 

Charging Cabinet     No Bid  $743.00 **  No Bid  No Bid  $877.36   $1,000.00  

Anywhere Cart AC-MINI-16       AC Mini 12         

                 

Dell D6000S Universal USB Dock – D6000S (only) No Bid  $240.00 *  No Bid  No Bid  $296.78   $300.00  
(DELL-D6000S)                

                 

                 
* Alternate                
** Does Not Meet Specifications              

 


