KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22

= PRICE PER UNIT
m
2 QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
#*

Cups, 2 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. Solo P200N Arctic Office $68.50

or approved equal US Foods No Bid

300 20 CASE 2,500 ct

Lids, 2 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. Lid must |Solo PL200N Arctic Office $61.61

fit Solo Brand 2 0z Cup #P200N or approved equal US Foods No Bid
301 20 CASE 2,500 ct

Cups, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only Solo P400N Arctic Office $132.25

US Foods $250.54

302 24 CASE | 2,500 ct or approved equal

Cups, 5.5 oz, Plastic, Translucent. Solo P550N Arctic Office $162.15

US Foods $287.73

303 24 CASE | 2,500 ct or approved equal

Lids, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. Lid must [Solo PL4N Arctic Office $90.25

fit Solo Brand 4 oz cup #P400N US Foods $82.15
304 30 CASE | 2,500 ct or approved equal

Valid: June 1, 2022 -> August 31, 2022




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22
= PRICE PER UNIT
m
2 QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
#*
Parfait Cup, Plastic, 16 oz Pactiv YP160C
or approved equal
305 15 CASE 700 ct Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid
Lids for Parfait Cup, Plastic, Dome Style Lid (No Hole). Lid |Pactiv YPDL24CNH
must fit Pactiv Brand Parfait Cup #YP160C or approved equal
306 10 CASE 900 ct Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid
Bowl, Oval, 28 oz Capacity, Molded Fiber Huhtamaki (Chinet) 28951
or approved equal
307 10 CASE 300 ct Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid
Bowl, 12 oz, Heavy-Weight Paper, Soak Proof, Dixie SXB12WS Arctic Office $69.95
Microwavable, Dixie Ulira or approved equal US Foods No Bid
308 10 CASE | 4/125ct
Container, Foam, 8 oz, Squat. Dart 8SJ20 Arctic Office $97.60
or approved equal US Foods No Bid
309 40 CASE 1,000 ct
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KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22
= PRICE PER UNIT
m
2 QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
#*
Deli Container/Lid Combo, Paper Deli Container w/Plastic |Huhtamaki (Chinet) 71203
Lid, 8-10 oz Capacity or approved equal
310 36 CASE 250 ct Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid
Container, Plastic, Hinged, Smart lock, 6", Small Pactiv YCI8-1160-0000 Arctic Office $158.80
Container. KPBSD 15-9032 US Foods $220.61
311 18 CASE 500 ct or approved equal
Container, Plastic, Single Hinged, Smart lock, 9", Clear,  [Pactiv YCI8-1110-0000 Arctic Office $152.42
Large, KPBSD 15-9033 US Foods $164 48
312 20 CASE 200 ct or approved equal
Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight Plastic, Nutri-bon 3606 US Foods $30.15
Includes spork, napkin and straw in a cellophane wrap. Global PM-MPPSPKIT
313 | 280 CASE 1,000 ct Dixie MWSKPC
or approved equal Arctic Office $36.57 Alt
Trays, 1/2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. Southern Champion 0409  |Arctic Office $37.38
Boardwalk BWK30LAG050
314 | 130 CASE 1,000 ct or approved equal US Foods No Bid
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KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22
= PRICE PER UNIT
m
2 QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
#*
Trays, 1#, Food Tray w/ Sides. Southern Champion 0413  |Arctic Office $45.49
Boardwalk BWK30LAG100
315 60 CASE 1,000 ct or approved equal US Foods No Bid
Trays, 2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. Southern Champion 0417  [US Foods $55.05
Arctic Office $56.80
316 48 CASE 1,000 ct Boardwalk BWK30LAG200
or approved equal
Trays, 5-Compartment, Foam Lunch Tray, 9"x12" Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX US Foods $60.21
Arctic Office $65.59
317 80 CASE 500 ct or approved equal
Napkins, Tall Fold, 7" x 13", Disposable Primesource 73004383 US Foods $82.28
or approved equal
318 15 CASE | 10,000 ct Arctic Office No Bid
Pan Liners, Super Release, 16 3/8" x 24 3/8" Paterson 24051610000
PrimeSource 25QPL NO AWARD
319 40 CASE 1,000 ct PrimeSource 75003991
or approved equal Arctic Office $103.60 Alt
US Foods No Bid
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KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22
= PRICE PER UNIT
E QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
*
Pan Liners, Steam Pan, Full Size, 6" Deep, Ovenable, Pan Saver 42002
34"x18". Fits Full Size Hotel Pan Pan Saver 658128420028
320 40 BOX 50 ct Pan Pals 22-PL3418 US Foods No Bid
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Bags, Bun Pan, Plastic, 27"x 37", High Density Heat HandGard 303679979 US Foods $52.07
Resistant. HandGard FB37RM (TuffGards)
321 20 CASE 200 ct or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Ziploc, Gallon, Freezer Bags Ziploc 682258 Arctic Office $38.05
US Foods $44.02
322 20 CASE 250 ct Ziploc 94604
or approved equal
PVC Film Food Wrap, 12"x2000' Roll w/ cutter guard edge. |Boardwalk 7202
or approved equal Arctic Office $19.33 Alt
323 10 ROLL | 12"x2000' US Foods 40.79 Alt
NO AWARD
PVC Film Food Wrap, 18"x2000' Roll w/ cutter guard edge. [Boardwalk 7204
Inteplast FSW1801
324 10 ROLL | 18"x2000' Empress EFF182 Arctic Office $26.83 Alt
or approved equal US Foods $52.72 Alt

Valid: June 1, 2022 -> August 31, 2022




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22
= PRICE PER UNIT
E QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
*
PVC Film Food Wrap, 24"x2000' Roll w/ cutter guard edge. |Boardwalk 7229
PrimeSource 75003838
325 5 ROLL | 24"x2000' Empress EFF242 Arctic Office $37.00 Alt
or approved equal US Foods $47.62 Alt
Aluminum Foil, 18"x1000' Roll, Dispenser Box w/ Cutter  |Boardwalk 7116 Arctic Office $55.00
Guard Edge. Handi-Foil HFA11807
326 10 ROLL | 18"x1000' or approved equal US Foods $147.78 Alt
Gloves, Size Small, Embossed, Food Grade Polyethylene, |PrimeSource 75007125
Disposable. 1,000 Gloves Per Box, 10,000 gloves per Empress EVPFS4001 Arctic Office $45.78 Alt
case. 10 boxes = 1 case :
327 1 CASE | 10,000 ct or approved equal US Foods No Bid
Gloves, Size Medium, Embossed, Food Grade PrimeSource 75007135
Polyethylene, Disposable. 1,000 Gloves Per Box, 10,000 Empress EVPFM4002 Arctic Office $45.05 Alt
gloves per case. 10 boxes = 1 case :
328 2 CASE | 10,000 ct or approved equal US Foods No Bid
Oven Mitts, 17", High-Heat Resistant up to 450 degrees F [San Jamar 800FG17-BK
or approved equal
329 20 PKG 1-Pair Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid

Valid: June 1, 2022 -> August 31, 2022




KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #118-22
= PRICE PER UNIT
m
2 QTY UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA
#*
Pot Holders, Bakers Pads, High Heat Resistant, 8"x8" San Jamar 802TF
or approved equal
330 5 PKG 12 ct Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid
Thermometer, Cooler/Freezer, Magnetic/Stick-On, Range: Taylor 5982N
-40° 0 120°F or approved equal
33 24 PKG 1 ct Arctic Office No Bid
US Foods No Bid
Thermometer, Pocket Probe Dial, Stainless Steel, 5", Rubbermaid PEL-THP220DS
Measures 0° to 220°F Cooper-Atkins 1246-02-1
332 10 PKG 1 ct or approved equal US Foods No Bid
Arctic Office No Bid
Box Cutter, Dual-Sided, NSF Certified and Dishwasher San Jamar KK403 Arctic Office $13.54
Safe or approved equal US Foods No Bid
333 10 PKG 3ct
Bottle, Squeeze w/squeeze dispenser lid, Plastic, 160z,  |Tablecraft 11663C
Clear or approved equal US Foods No Bid
334 4 CASE 12 ct Arctic Office No Bid
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