KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Dry Food Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #119-22
_ QTY UNIT |[PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT FOB
m SOLDOTNA
=
Tomatoes, Diced in Juice, Canned. Angela Mia 2700037854 US Foods $50.05
S&W 192113 Peterkin $29.93
100 32 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Tomato Paste, Canned. Red Gold RPKUA99
S&W 192119 Peterkin $44.93
101 56 CASE 6/#10 Roseli 170192 US Foods 67.67 Alt
or approved equal
Tomato Sauce, Canned. Red Gold RPKHA99
S&W 192118 Peterkin $28.43
102 32 CASE 6/#10 Roseli 176900 US Foods 50.63 Alt
or approved equal
Beans, Refried, Traditional, Canned. Rosarita 4430010641 Peterkin $39.68
US Foods $61.94
103 112 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Beans, Baked, Maple, Canned Bush's 1619 Peterkin $67.23
US Foods $73.59
104 | 168 CASE | 6/118 0z or approved equal
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Kidney Beans, Canned, Low Sodium Bush's 1745 Peterkin $50.15
US Foods $59.37
105 24 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Black Beans, Canned, Low Sodium Bush's 1885 US Foods $58.34
Peterkin $67.22
106 24 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Corn, Canned, Low Sodium Del Monte 2004499 Peterkin $33.68
Monarch 170119 US Foods 52.54 Alt
107 112 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Apples, Sliced in Water, Canned, No Added Sugar  |Monarch 162065 US Foods $76.18
or approved equal
108 56 CASE 6/#10 Peterkin No Bid
Pineapple Tidbits, Canned Dole 00553 Peterkin $56.93
US Foods $64.94
109 168 CASE 6/#10 National Food Group 614154
or approved equal
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Peaches, Diced, Light Syrup, Canned Del Monte 2002349 Peterkin $70.64
Monarch 541056 US Foods 85.41 Alt
110 112 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Pears, Diced, Light Syrup, Canned Del Monte 2002352 Peterkin $67.97
Monarch 548403 US Foods 78.41 Alt
111 112 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Diced Mango in 100% Fruit Juice, Packed in 40z Dole 100-38900-00443-6 US Foods $24.96
Plastic Cups. Peterkin $24.99
112 | 420 CASE 36/40z or approved equal
Mixed Fruit Cups, Peaches, Pears and Grapes in Zee Zee's (NFG) 1765 US Foods $69.36
o 1
100% Juice, Shelf Stable. or approved equal
113 160 CASE | 72/4.50z Peterkin No Bid
Applesauce Cups, No Sugar Added, Shelf Stable Tree Top 4878 US Foods $30.39
Peterkin $38.23
114 | 180 CASE | 72/4.50z or approved equal
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Orange, Mandarin Segments in Pear Juice. Shelf Nu-Health Fruit 858844006005
Stable, No Added Sugar. Provides 1/2 cup of fruitto  [pa Monte 2400 Peterkin $19.69 Alt
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. —
115 | 256 CASE | 96/4.50z or approved equal US Foods No Bid
NO AWARD
Mayonnaise, Light, Packaged in plastic bucket. Signature 13832
Ventura 77031VEN
116 30 TUB 30# Ventura 13304VEN US Foods $37.74 Alt
or approved equal Peterkin No Bid
Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat, One gallon, Light Kraft 10021000643018 US Foods $85.06
Mayannaise or approved equal Peterkin $88.60
117 5 CASE 4/1gal
Mayonnaise, Portion Control, Reduced Fat, 12g. Heinz 10013000532058 Peterkin $30.09
Portion Pac 10013000532058
118 40 CASE | 200/12g Monarch 270015 US Foods $23.02 Alt
or approved equal
Mustard, Portion Control, Yellow, Prepared. Kraft/Heinz 7160370539000  |US Foods $15.43
French's 41500-85398
119 30 CASE | 500/5.5g French's 901559255 Peterkin $16.83 Alt
or approved equal
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Ketchup, Portion Control Packets, Low Sodium Heinz 10013000565001
Red Gold REDYL9G
120 | 144 CASE | 1000/9g French's 419559301 US Foods $47.43 Alt
Hellman's 67880151 Peterkin $39.35 Alt
or approved equal
Ketchup, Canned, Low Sodium Red Gold REDYL99
Hunt's 2700038251 US Foods $56.00 Alt
121 32 CASE 6/#10 Heinz 512096 Peterkin $59.69 Alt
or approved equal
Ketchup, Dispenser Pouch Pack, Low Sodium. Heinz 10013000515686 US Foods $43.19
French's 419626300 Peterkin $39.43 Alt
122 40 CASE | 2/1.5gal or approved equal
Soy Sauce, Portion Control Packets, Reduced Sodium |Kikkoman 00116 US Foods $26.70
Kikkoman 00278 Peterkin $16.77 Alt
123 20 CASE | 500/6ml or approved equal
Sauce, Sweet & Sour Sauce, Portion Pack. Schwan's 69737 US Foods $17.10
Peterkin $18.84
124 20 CASE | 250/11g or approved equal
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Salsa, Mild, Gallon, Plastic Jug Only. Rosarita 4430010688 US Foods $72.85
Peterkin $75.28
125 40 CASE 4/1gal or approved equal
Syrup Cup, Portion Control, Low-Sugar, 1.5 0z Madeira 7160371396000 US Foods $22.08
Kraft/Heinz 7160371396000
126 40 CASE | 100/1.5 0z or approved equal
Peterkin No Bid
BBQ Sauce, Gallon, Plastic Jug Only. Heinz 10013000539507 US Foods $74.02
Kraft 678966 Peterkin $66.52 Alt
127 5 CASE 4/1gal or approved equal
Marinara Sauce Portion Cups Red Gold REDNA2ZC84
Heinz 10013000529300 US Foods $29.24 Alt
128 100 CASE | 84/2.50z Heinz 529300 Peterkin $33.71 Alt
or approved equal NO AWARD
Ranch Dressing, Reduced Fat, Portion Control Ken's KE0041B3 US Foods $22.75
Pouches Marzetii 83985 Peterkin $27.09 Al
129 30 CASE | 60/1.50z or approved equal
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Caesar Dressing, Plastic Jug Kraft 10021000705068 US Foods $95.40
Peterkin $96.39
130 5 CASE 4/1gal or approved equal
Pickles, Dill, Sliced, Crinkle Cut, Pouch Pack. Heinz 10013000658208 Peterkin $53.12
US Foods $78.57
131 30 CASE 6/5.75# or approved equal
Cheese Sauce, Cheddar. One Serving Must Provide 1 {Land o Lakes 39940 US Foods $98.47
0z meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal .
) Peterkin $100.56
Pattern Requirements.
132 48 CASE | 6/1060z or approved equal
Chips, Tortilla, Triangle, Ready to eat, Whole Grain.  |Mission 08619 US Foods $27.64
One serving must provide 1 0z equivalent grains to .
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin $3261
133 90 CASE 6/2# or approved equal
Potatoes, Instant, Dehydrated Idahoan 29700003019 Peterkin $76.62
US Foods $87.82
134 45 CASE | 12/28 oz or approved equal
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Cereal, Honey Bunches of Oats, Whole Grain, Post 108-84912-27315-1 US Foods $41.31
Bowlpak. Product must provide 1 0z equivalent grains or aboroved equal
per serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern PP 1
135 45 CASE 96/1 oz Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Cereal, Marshmallow Mateys, Whole Grain, Bowlpak. |pPost 100-42400-27596-8 US Foods $16.43
Product must provide 1 0z equivalent grains per or approved equal
serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
136 90 CASE 96/1 oz Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Cereal, Cinnamon Toast Crunch, Bowlpak, Reduced |General Mills 29444000 US Foods $12.82
Sugar. Product must provide 1 oz equivalent grains or aporoved equal
per serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern PP d . -
137 90 CASE 96/1 oz Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Cereal, Cocoa Puffs, Whole Grain, Bowlpak, Reduced (General Mills 31888000 US Foods $18.74
Sugar. Product must provide 1 oz equivalent grains or approved equal
per serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
138 90 CASE | 96/1.06 oz Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Granola, Bulk Pack, Oats 'n Honey, Whole Grain General Mills 16000-37854000 |US Foods $45.84
Granola for Parfait
or approved equal
139 20 CASE 4/500z Peterkin No Bid
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Animal Crackers, Whole Grain, Individual Packs. Bake Crafters 526 US Foods $29.76
Product must provide 1 oz equivalent grains to meet ; .
Kell 79783487 Peterk 43.01
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements ellogg's 7978348786 eern $
140 [ 100 CASE | 100/1.10z or approved equal
Annie's Bunny Grahams, Honey, Chocolate & Annie's 1356200237 US Foods $30.16 Alt
Chocolate Chip. Product must provide 1 0z equivalent General Mills 600237000 Peterkin $42.86
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern '
141 100 CASE | 100/1.250z Requirements or approved equal
Juice, Fruitables, Gold Rush, 100% Juice. Product  [Apple & Eve 24025 US Foods $14.92
must provide 1/2 cup red/orange vegetable per Juicy Juice 79564 Peterkin $21.28
serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern -
142 | 560 CASE | 40/4.230z Requirements. or approved equal
Juice, Orange Medley Vegetable Juice, 100% Juicy Juice 00066 Peterkin $16.86
Vegetable Juice, No Added Sugar. Product must Apple & Eve 86003 US Foods $19.86
provide 1/2 cup red/orange vegetable per serving to '
143 | 540 | CASE | 40/4.230 | et Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal NO AWARD
Juice, Apple, Shelf Stable, Plastic Cup, 100% Juice  [Ocean Spray 00720 US Foods $18.61
Peterkin $18.65
144 | 300 CASE 48/40z or approved equal
Valid: June 1, 2022 -> August 31, 2022 9
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Juice, Orange, Shelf Stable, Plastic Cup, 100% Juice Ocean Spray 00725 Peterkin $20.24
US Foods $20.28
145 200 CASE 48/40z or approved equal
Water, Bottled, 16.9 oz Plastic Bottle. Kirkland Peterkin $8.99
Alaska Glacier US Foods $8.18 Alt
146 48 CASE | 40/16.90z or approved equal NO AWARD
Au Jus Powder Mix, Instant Foothill Farms 077T-T0700  [Peterkin $39.75
US Foods $45.06
147 2 CASE 12/80z or approved equal
Gravy Mix, Beef, Instant, No MSG, Low Sodium. Diamond Crystal 57774 US Foods $31.69
Peterkin $36.66
148 20 CASE 8/14 oz or approved equal
Gravy Mix, Chicken, Instant, No MSG, Low Sodium.  [Diamond Crystal 57773 US Foods $33.46
Peterkin $46.55
149 20 CASE 8/15 oz or approved equal
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Dressing Mix, Ranch, No MSG. Foothill Farms V402-60190  |US Foods $60.03
Peterkin $69.55
150 15 CASE 10# or approved equal
Dressing Mix, Italian Kraft/Heinz 10043000846060 |US Foods $67.92
Peterkin $71.41
151 3 CASE | 12/7.60z or approved equal
Lemon Juice, Plastic Bottle. Suntree 521 US Foods $51.23
Realemon 148005824204 121480z  |Peterkin $49.88
152 1 CASE 12/320z or approved equal
Oil, Canola, Gallon. Chef's Pride 58501CHP US Foods $48.51
or approved equal Peterkin $45.50 Alt
153 10 CASE 3/1gal NO AWARD
Pan Coating Spray, Canola. Vegalene 17260 US Foods $34.19
Conagra 6414407263
154 3 CASE 6/170z or approved equal
Peterkin No Bid
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Spice, Oregano Leaves Monarch 207192 US Foods $7.63
Pacific Spice Peterkin $34.89
155 3 CASE 6/5 oz Culinary Origin
or approved equal
Spice, Marjoram Leaves Pacific Spice 26489 Peterkin $24.40
Durkee 738194
156 1 CASE 6/4 oz or approved equal
Monarch 203869 US Foods $27.71 Alt
Spice, Basil Leaves. Culinary Secret 2005163
Pacific Spice 26255 Peterkin $26.90
157 3 CASE 6/5.5 0z Monarch 203845 US Foods $6.81
or approved equal
Spice, Chili Powder Mild. Monarch 203859 US Foods $62.75
Pacific Spice CHILPWR112  |Peterkin $51.40
158 8 CASE 6/18 oz or approved equal
Spice, Cumin Powder, Ground. Monarch 207822 US Foods $75.36
Pacific Spice 2100 Peterkin $50.50
159 5 CASE 6/16 oz or approved equal
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Spice, Mrs. Dash, No MSG, Gluten Free. Mrs. Dash J016-AY900 Peterkin $34.84
Mrs. Dash 80260049 US Foods $38.60 Alt
160 5 CASE | 6/6.750z or approved equal
Spice, Garlic Powder. Monarch 208867 US Foods $88.56
Pacific Spice 34197 Peterkin $52.90
161 10 CASE 6/21 oz or approved equal
Spice, Onion Flakes, Chopped, Dehydrated. Durkee 2004055 US Foods $21.19
Pacific Spice 26130 Peterkin $29.10
162 30 EACH 3# or approved equal
Spice, Black Pepper, Ground. Monarch 207215
Pacific Spice 26190 Peterkin $61.00
163 4 CASE 6/16 oz Monarch 207214 US Foods $97.25 Alt
or approved equal
Spice, Salt, lodized. Morton F110530005G
Monarch 200184 2412602 US Foods $38.08 Alt
164 2 CASE 12/260z or approved equal Peterkin $49.12 Alt
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Spice, Thyme Leaves. Monarch 207266 US Foods $58.70
Pacific Spice 26215 Peterkin $34.60
165 2 CASE 6/7 oz or approved equal
Spice, Paprika Monarch 208196 US Foods $79.02
Pacific Spice Peterkin $101.80
166 1 CASE 12/160z or approved equal
Sugar, Brown, 2# bags C&H 404832 Peterkin $37.45
US Foods $58.47
167 5 CASE 16/2# or approved equal
Sugar, White, Granulated C&H 30625 US Foods $55.61
or approved equal Peterkin $57.55
168 1 CASE 10/4#
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