KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Frozen Food Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #120-22
PACK PRICE PER PRICE PER
= [ QTY| UNIT ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR UNIT FOB UNIT FOB
m SIZE
i SOLDOTNA| ANCHORAGE
Hamburger Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Baked,  |Franz 74329 Peterkin $48.84
Sliced. One bun must provide 2 oz equivalent Baker Boy 31014 US Foods $50.41 $49.54
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern - -
200 | 300 | CASE | 120/20z Requirements. or approved equal
Hoagie Rolls, 5", Whole Grain, Hinge Sliced.  |Franz (Oven Fresh) 62852 US Foods $26.43 $25.79
Each roll must provide 2.25 oz equivalent or approved equal Peterkin No Bid
201 | 60 | case | 7223 grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
002 Requirements.
Dinner Rolls, Baked, Whole Grain. Each roll  (Baker Boy 31142 US Foods $50.80 $50.04
must provide 1 oz equivalent grains to meet  [Aynt Millies 7488 (192t Peterkin $41.83 Alt
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
202 | 108 | CASE 180 ct or approved equal
Biscuit Sticks, Frozen. One serving must Rich's 16317 US Foods $40.42 $39.38
provide 1 0z equivalent grains to meet Child Peterkin $45.54
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. -
203 [ 80 | CASE (250/1.2507 a or approved equal
Texas Toast, Garlic, Whole Grain, Bulk Pack. |Bake Crafters 1647 US Foods $36.30 $35.61
One serving must provide 2 oz equivalent European Bakers Peterkin $49.06 Alt
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
204 | 120 | CASE |108/1.80z Requirements. or approved equal
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English Muffin, Sliced, 3.5", Whole Grain. One (Burry 88001 US Foods $27.71 $27.22
serving must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to Franz 61664 Peterkin $44.10 Alt
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern -
205 | 30 | CASE | 7220z Requirements. or approved equal
Croissants, Sliced, Fully Cooked, Whole Bake Crafters 1662 Peterkin No Bid
Grain, |Onte Sonng mUSttpémT\Jth? 1og |B2KT BoY 32660 US Foods 55240 At]  $52.96 Alt
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Mea
206 | 30 | CASE |144/2.40z Pattern Requirements. or approved equal NO AWARD
Bread, White, Gluten-Free, Frozen Loaf, UDI's (Conagra) 9899780901 US Foods $49.83 $49.34
Sliced. or approved equal Peterkin No Bid
207 | 10 | CASE | 6/240z
Flour Tortilla, Heat Pressed, Whole Grain, 10" |Don Pancho 79341.02205 US Foods $42.62 $41.57
La Mexicana 17121 Peterkin $45.78 Alt
208 [ 25 | CASE | 12/12ct or approved equal
Hot Dog Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Fully Baked |Baker Boy 31034 US Foods $54.47 $53.70
and Sliced. Franz 74932 Peterkin 67.73 Alt
209 | 60 | CASE |144/1.50z or approved equal
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AWARD IN BOLD Bid #120-22
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Beef Hot Dogs, 6", CN Labeled. Product Must |Smithfield/Farmland 7024781096 |US Foods $39.12 $38.59
Provide 2.00 oz meat/meat alternate to meet Peterkin $48.82
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. -
210| 60 | CASE 80 ct Made With 100% USDA inspected cuts of or approved equal
Beef with no fillers or extenders.
Whole Grain Breaded Beef Finger, Fully Tyson (AP) 10000097886 US Foods $114.06 $112.43
Cooked, CN labeled. One Serving must or approved equal
a1 | 50 | case |s00197 provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz :
9702 o uivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal [1YSOn (alf) Peterkin 52.65 Al
Pattern Requirements.
Beef, Teriyaki Nugget, Fully Cooked, CN Tyson (AP) 10000013827 US Foods $144.87 $143.91
Labeled. One Serving must provide 2 oz Peterkin $146.60
212 | a1 | case oo meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition .
© OZ|\leal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal
Beef, Philly Steak Strips, Fully Cooked, Steak |Tyson 10000097565 US Foods $89.99 $89.44
Eze Redi Steak Peterkin $89.49
213 [ 50 | CASE 10# or approved equal
Beef Patty, Fully Cooked, Flamebroiled. One  |Tyson (AP) 10000037600
Serving must provide 2 0z meat/meat JTM 5670CE US Foods $136.67 135.00
ME casE | 140m alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern - -
68 0/2.30z Requirements. Advance Pierre 10000068097 Peterkin 88.63 Alt
or approved equal
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Beef Crumbles, Fully Cooked, 1/4 Inch King's Command 70549
Crumbles JTM 5868CE US Foods $130.96 $129.38
215 | 200 | CASE 10# Pizzano Peterkin 44.74 Alt
or approved equal
Turkey, Sliced, Oven Roasted, Reduced Hormel 32232 US Foods $105.35 $104.70
Sodium, 0.50z Slices. Double L Ranch Peterkin 81.70 Alt
216 [ 20 | CASE 6/2# or approved equal
Ham, Sliced, Smoked, Reduced Sodium, Hormel 32225 US Foods $67.80 $67.15
0.50z Slices Double L Ranch Peterkin 62.20 Al
217 | 20 | CASE 6/2# or approved equal
Chicken, Tangerine, Whole Grain Breaded,  Int. Food Solutions 72001 US Foods $228.53 $226.30
Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. One serving must Peterkin $222.89
provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 0.5 0z -
218 | 48 | CASE |176/3.90z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal [°" approved equal
Pattern Requirements
Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, |Tyson 2154-928 US Foods $95.02 $93.36
Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. One patty must Peterkin $94.90
219 | 40 | case 1501329 provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz -
2907 e quivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal |27 @PProved equal
Pattern Requirements.
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Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, |Tyson 70302-928 US Foods $144.99 $143.31
Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. One patty must Peterkin $145.60
220 | 48 | case 1321375 provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz -
19020 quivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal |[°F @PProved equal
Pattern Requirements.
Chicken, Breaded Strips, Whole Grain Tyson 703322-928 Peterkin $150.34
Breaded, FutIIy CO%keg, CN La?/e'ed-t OlTe | Goldkist 625300 US Foods 102.05 At 100.45 Alt
serving must provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate
221 40 | CASE | 110/4.50z and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child or approved equal
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Popcorn Chicken, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully |Goldkist 110452 US Foods $97.85 $96.26
Cooked, CN Labeled. One serving must Peterkin $115.09
222 | 96 | case |108/43 provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 1 oz .
302 o quivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal [O" @PProved equal
Pattern Requirements.
Corn Pup Dogs, Chicken, Whole Grain, CN  |Foster Farms 96086 US Foods $31.37 $30.82
Labeled. One serving must provide 2 0z Peterkin $32.23
meat/meat alternate and 2 0z equivalent :
223 | 260 | CASE 10% grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Tasty Brands 64010
Requirements. or approved equal
BBQ Pork Rib Patty, Fully Cooked with BBQ  |Tyson/Advance Pierre 3817 US Foods $130.74 $129.63
Sauce, CN Labeled. One serving must provide Peterkin $128.22
224 | 52 | case 100325 2 0z meat/meat alternate to meet Child '
2999 Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal
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Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat, Reduced [Land o Lakes 43274 US Foods $84.28 $82.65
Sodium, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. Product Peterkin $87.10
225 | 126 | case 6/54 must provide 2.00 oz meat/meat alternate and -
1 0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition |°" @PProved equal
Meal Pattern Requirements.
Enchilada Empanada, Chicken & Cheese,  |Albie's 860 US Foods $61.35 $60.60
Whole Grain, Bulk Pack. Product must provide Peterkin No Bid
2 0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent
226 | 120 | CASE | 48/50z grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern or approved equal
Requirements.
Taco Snack, Beef, WG, Bulk Pack, CN Fernando's 5211 US Foods $52.81 $51.78
Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz Peterkin $61.98
227 | 80 | case | 605 meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent .
OZ | 5rains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern |07 @PProved equal
Requirements.
Pizzaboli, Cheese Calzone, Whole Grain, Bulk [Tasty Brands 53201 US Foods $104.03 $102.48
Pack. Product must provide 2 0z meat/meat Peterkin $83.72
alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet -
228 [ 112 | CASE | 96/50z Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements or approved equal
Big Daddy's Pepperoni Stuffed Sandwich,  |Big Daddy's 55293 (IW) US Foods 56.65 Alt 55.93 Alt
Whole Grain, Bulk Pack, CN Labeled. Product Schwan's 55290 (Bulk) Peterkin $59.27
229 | 180 | case |s/4.48 must provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate and 2 -
4002 7 equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition |07 @PProved equal
Meal Pattern Requirements.
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Pizza, Tony's 4x6 Cheese Pizza, Whole Grain, [Tony's 78697 US Foods $76.14 $74.64
CN Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz Peterkin $81.35
230 | 62 | case | o645 meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent -
90Z | 3rains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern  [OF @PProved equal
Requirements.
Pizza, Big Daddy's, 16" Cheese Pizza, Whole [Schwan's 78637 US Foods $98.80 $97.48
Grain, CN Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz Peterkin $99.56
meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent :
231 96 | CASE |72/5.180z grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern or approved equal
Requirements.
Pizza, Breakfast Pizza, 51% Whole Grain, Tony's 63912 US Foods $77.41 $75.89
Turkey Sausage, CN Labeled. Product must Peterkin $76.76
232 | 64 | case |12813.31 provide 1 0z meat/meat alternate and 1.5 oz .
310214 quivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal [°F @PProved equal
Pattern Requirements.
French Bread Multi-Cheese Garlic, 6", Whole [Schwan's 68724 US Foods $75.69 $74.79
Grain, CN Labeled. One serving must provide Peterkin $76.66
2 0z meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent -
233 | 70 | CASE |60/4.290z grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern or approved equal
Requirements.
The Max Mozzarella Cheese Filled Conagra 7738712602 US Foods $74.64 $73.37
Breadsticks, 51% Whole Grain, CN Labeled. Peterkin $80.12
234 | 126 | case 1921 One stick must provide 1 0z meat/meat -
902 ) . ternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet O @PProved equal
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
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Spaghetti, Short-Cut, Whole Grain Marzetti 41308-31002 US Foods $49.64 $48.59
Dakota Growers Peterkin 24 41 Al
235 | 120 | CASE 20# or approved equal
Rotini Pasta, Tri-Color, Frozen, Pre-Cooked.  [Marzetti 41308-26007 US Foods $39.56 $38.61
Peterkin $40.66
236 [ 40 | CASE 6/3# or approved equal
Whole Grain Maple Glazed French Toast Michael Foods 46025-75010-00  |US Foods $53.05 $52.15
Sticks, Fully Cooked, CN Labeled. Each 2.9 Peterkin $59.54
237 | 168 | case | 859 0z serving must provide 1 0z meat/meat .
902 | olternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet [Sunny Fresh 40497
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.  |or approved equal
StrawberryBoli, IW, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. |Tasty Brands 53205 US Foods $70.81 $69.79
Product Must Provide 2 0z equivalent grains to Peterkin $69.67
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern '
238 | 72 | CASE |[96/3.240z Requirements. or approved equal
Pancakes, Mini, Strawberry Flavor, Whole  |Bake Crafters 1702 US Foods $51.66 $51.01
Grain, Individually Wrapped, CN Labeled. - pyyipy,ry 18000-37731 Peterkin 43.78 Alt
23 casE | 7ap Product Must Provide 2 oz equivalent grains to
9| 80 802 | et Child Nutrition Meal Patter or approved equal
Requirements.
Valid: June 1, 2022 -> August 31, 2022 8



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Frozen Food Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #120-22
PACK PRICE PER PRICE PER
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR UNIT FOB UNIT FOB
i SOLDOTNA| ANCHORAGE
Muffin, Blueberry, 51% Whole Grain, Product |Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 US Foods $39.93 $39.39
must provide 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Peterkin $45.48
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. :
240 | 100 | CASE | T72/20z e Ui e or approved equal
Waffles, Blueberry Flavor, Whole Grain, CN  |Bake Crafters 1591 Peterkin $57.17
Lab,e'ef- Pr"dt“éthq:j“;t Firft’,"'d‘,*vlz "lzpe‘if'va'e”t Pillsbury 1800032265 US Foods $50.06 $58.36
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern
241 | 100 | CASE | 72/2.60z Requirements. or approved equal
Banana Chocolate Chunk Benefit Bar. Product|J&J Snackfoods 40402 US Foods $32.42 $31.97
must provide 2 0z equivalent grains to meet Peterkin $32.45
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. .
242 | 120 | CASE | 48/2.50z or approved equal
Super Slice Banana Bread, IW, 51% Whole  [Super Bakery 6071 (discontinued) Peterkin $52.38
Grain, |CNt Lab,e'e‘t’- PrOdfgh’_‘l’(;‘i F;r,‘;,"'deMz ©7 |Super Bakery 7501 US Foods 58.83 Al 57.98 Alt
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Mea
243 | 84 | CASE | 70/3.40z Pattern Requirements. or approved equal
Super Bakery Baked Cinnamon Bun, Whole  |Super Bakery 6070 US Foods $44.66 $43.95
Grain. Product must provide 2 oz equivalent Peterkin $46.04
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern -
244 | 80 | CASE | 72/2.90z Requirements or approved equal
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Cookie, Sugar Cookie, Reduced Fat, Whole  |J&J Snackfoods 14925 US Foods $91.67 $90.51
Grain. Product must provide 1.25 oz Peterkin $87.96
245 | 20 | case oot 85 equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal -
©29%pattern Requirements or approved equal
Crinkle Cut Fries, Seasoned, Crispy, 1/2" Mccain 1000007470 US Foods $75.60 $74.01
Deep Groove, Low Sodium Peterkin $77.98
246 | 120 | CASE 6/5# or approved equal
Hash Brown Rounds, Coin-shaped Hash Mccain 1000006188 Peterkin $78.11
Browns, Low Sodium. Simplot 1071179049555 US Foods 44.49 Al 42.89 Alt
247 | 80 | CASE 6/5# or approved equal
NO AWARD
Tater Tots, Reduced Sodium Simplot 10071179004189 US Foods $42.56 $40.96
Peterkin $69.70
248 | 200 | CASE 6/5# or approved equal
Fried Rice, Whole Grain, Frozen, Made with  |Minh 69074 US Foods $83.98 $82.35
brown rice, carrots, peas, corn and authentic Peterkin $82.32
Asian seasonings. '
249 | 100 | CASE | 84/5.90z or approved equal
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Broccoli Cuts, Frozen Simplot 10071179180586 US Foods $39.66 $38.38
Peterkin $45.20
250 | 30 | CASE 12/2# or approved equal
Vegetable, Winter Mix, Blend of Broccoli and  |Simplot 10071179188070 US Foods $39.50 $38.24
Cauliflower, IQF Peterkin $45.10
251 | 72 | CASE 12/2# or approved equal
Cheese, Yellow American, Sliced, 50% Land O Lakes 46288 US Foods $96.15 $94.60
Reduced Fat, 50% Reduced Sodium, Peterkin $107.33
Pasteurized Processed. One serving must .
252 | 20 | CASE 6/5# |provide 1 0z meat/meat alternate to meet or approved equal
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Cheese, Mozzarella, Sliced Metro Deli 311195 US Foods $46.92 $46.42
Peterkin No Bid
253 | 10 | CASE | 6/1.5# Great Lakes 3056
or approved equal
Cheese, Mozzarella, Shredded Land O Lakes 41698 US Foods $65.84 $64.76
Peterkin $74.17
254 | 10 | CASE 4/5# or approved equal
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Parmesan Cheese, Shredded Della Vita 41880
Roseli 908187 US Foods $129.34 $128.24
255 | 5 CASE 4/5%# Galbani 1/2.5# Peterkin 15.21 Alt
or approved equal
Parmesan Cheese, Grated Kraft/Heinz 10021000615688 US Foods $32.12 $31.84
Peterkin $31.69
256 [ 20 | CASE 1/5# or approved equal
Butter, Unsalted, 1# Blocks Glenview Farms 4268644 US Foods $118.94 $117.34
Larsen's Creamery sei1# Peterkin 133.39 Alt
257 | 4 CASE 30/1# Columbia Valley 06327
or approved equal
Bacon, Pre-cooked slices, 100% real bacon, |[Hormel 03729 US Foods $52.50 $52.30
warm & serve. Daily's Peterkin 72.00 Alt
258 [ 20 | CASE (300 Slices or approved equal
Triple Berry Blend, IQF, Frozen mix of Simplot 10071179016311 US Foods $70.09 $68.99
strawberries, blackberries and blueberries, No Peterkin $77.56
sugar added. -
259 | 20 | CASE 4/5# or approved equal
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Juice, Apple, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 0z Johanna Peterkin $30.00
liquid, 100% Juice Ardmore 41381 US Foods $41.20 $39.78
260 | 280 | CASE | 96/4oz Sig 62678
or approved equal
Juice, Orange, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 oz Johanna Peterkin $30.57
liquid, 100% Juice. Ardmore 41380 US Foods $44.13 $42.70
261 | 224 | CASE | 96/4oz Sig 62681
or approved equal
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