KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Tomato Paste, Canned. Red Gold RPKUA99
S&W 192119 Peterkin $55.29
100 32 CASE | 6410 or approved equal US Foods $67.99 Alt
Beans, Refried, Traditional, Canned. Rosarita 4430010641 Peterkin $48.83
US Foods $75.74
101 56 CASE 6/#10 or approved equal
Beans, Baked, Maple, Canned Bush's 1619 Peterkin $69.42
US Foods $81.72
102 56 CASE | 6/118 oz or approved equal
Pineapple Tidbits, Canned Dole 00553
National Food Group 614154 Peterkin $58.93
103 56 CASE | 6410 or approved equal US Foods No Bid
Peaches, Diced, Light Syrup, Canned Del Monte 2002349 Peterkin $80.93
or approved equal US Foods $106.66 Alt
104 56 CASE | 6/#10

RECAP



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Diced Mango in 100% Fruit Juice, Packed in  [Dole 100-38900-00443-6 Peterkin $26.88
40z Plastic Cups. US Foods $30.47
105 | 210 CASE | 36/40z or approved equal
Mixed Fruit Cups, Peaches, Pears and Zee Zee's (NFG) 1765 US Foods $79.16
Grapes in 100% Juice, Shelf Stable.
or approved equal
106 | 160 | CASE | 72/4.50z Dole 03065 36/4 oz Peterkin $26.88 Alt
Applesauce Cups, No Sugar Added, Shelf  [Tree Top 4878 US Foods $32.43
Stable or approved equal Peterkin No Bid
107 60 CASE | 72/4.50z
Orange, Mandarin Segments in Pear Juice.  |Ny-Health Fruit 858844006005
Shelf Stable, No Added Sugar. Provides 1/2 or approved equal
cup of fruit to meet Child Nutrition Meal
108 128 CASE | 96/4.50z |pgttern Requirements. Dole 4208 36/4 oz Peterkin $26.88 Alt
US Foods $72.30 Alt
Mayonnaise, Light, Packaged in plastic Signature 13832
bucket. Ventura 77031VEN
109 15 TUB 30# Kraft 00021000642212 US Foods $80.17
or approved equal Peterkin No Bid

RECAP



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat, One gallon, Light | Kraft 10021000643018 US Foods $84.78
Mayonnaise Peterkin $99.35
110 5 CASE | 4/1gal or approved equal
Mayonnaise, Portion Control, Reduced Fat,  |[Heinz 10013000532058
129 Portion Pac 10013000532058
11 20 CASE | 200/12g or approved equal Peterkin $33.23 Alt
Monarch 270015 US Foods $23.79 Alt
Mustard, Portion Control, Yellow, Prepared.  |Kraft/Heinz 7160370539000
French's 41500-85398
112 20 CASE | 500/5.59 or approved equal Peterkin $16.83 Alt
Portion Pac 716037053901 US Foods $15.74
Ketchup, Portion Control Packets, Low Heinz 10013000565001
Sodium Red Gold REDYLOG
113 60 CASE | 1000/9g or approved equal Peterkin $42.35 Alt
Heinz 10013000984802 US Foods $37.49 Alt
Ketchup, Canned, Low Sodium Red Gold REDYL99
or approved equal
114 16 CASE | 6/#10 Hunts 2700038251 US Foods $66.15 Alt
Peterkin No Bid

RECAP



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
ﬂ QTY UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Ketchup, Dispenser Pouch Pack, Low Heinz 10013000515686
Sodium. or approved equal Peterkin $41.43 Alt
15| 20 CASE | 2/1.5gal US Foods $50.65 Alt
Salsa, Mild, Gallon, Plastic Jug Only. Rosarita 4430010688 Peterkin $72.80
US Foods $79.29
116 20 CASE | 4/1gal or approved equal
Syrup Cup, Portion Control, Low-Sugar, 1.5  |Madeira 7160371396000
oz Kraft/Heinz 7160371396000
117 40 CASE (100/1.5 oz or approved equal US Foods $21.26 Alt
Peterkin No Bid
BBQ Sauce, Gallon, Plastic Jug Only. Heinz 10013000539507 US Foods $76.24
or approved equal
118 5 CASE | 4/gal Kraft 678966 Peterkin $71.92 Alt
Marinara Sauce Portion Cups. Product must |Red Gold REDNA2ZC168
provide 1/2 Cup Serving of Red/Orange .
Vegetable per 2.50z to meet Child Nutrition or approved equal Peterkin $33.71 Al
119 112 CASE | 168/2.50z Meal Pattern Requirements. US Foods $34.69 Alt
NO AWARD

RECAP



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Ranch Dressing, Reduced Fat, Portion Ken's KE0041B3 US Foods $22.75
Control Pouches
or approved equal
120 30 CASE | 60/1.50z Peterkin No Bid
Potatoes, Instant, Dehydrated Idahoan 29700003019 Peterkin $82.41
US Foods $87.82
121 20 CASE | 12/28 oz or approved equal
Cereal, Frosted Flakes, Reduced Sugar, Kellogg's 038000549984 US Foods $35.05
Whole Grain, Bowlpak. Product must provide
) ) , or approved equal
1 0z equivalent grains per serving to meet : :
122| 45 | CASE | 96/10z |chiid Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Cereal, Frosted Mini Wheats, Whole Grain,  |Kellogg's 038000049965 US Foods $35.68
Bowlpak. Product must provide 1 oz
) ) ) , or approved equal
equivalent grains per serving to meet Child - :
123| 45 | CASE | 96/10z |\ytrifion Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Cereal, Marshmallow Mateys, Whole Grain,  |post 100-42400-27596-8 US Foods $19.55
Bowlpak. Product must provide 1 0z
. . ) . or approved equal
equivalent grains per serving to meet Child
124 45 CASE | 96/10z Peterkin No Bid

Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
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KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Cereal, Cinnamon Toast Crunch, Bowlpak, | General Mills 29444000 US Foods $32.08
Reduced Sugar. Product must provide 1 oz
\ . . . or approved equal
equivalent grains per serving to meet Child - -
125| 45 | CASE | 96/10Z |Nyprition Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Cereal, Cocoa Puffs, Whole Grain, Bowlpak, |General Mills 31888000 US Foods $28.46
Reduced Sugar. Product must provide 1 oz
. . . . or approved equal
equivalent grains per serving to meet Child - -
126 | 45 | CASE | 96/1.06 0z|Nyrition Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin No Bid
Quaker Chewy Granola Bar, Cookies & Pepsico 10030000565862 US Foods $45.83
Cream, Whole Grain. Product must provide 1 or anproved equal
oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition i . : :
127 | 100 | CASE [125/1.370Z|\1eal Pattern Requirements Peterkin No Bid
Cinnamon Graham Cracker Bears, Whole  [J&J Snackfoods 056072 US Foods $40.38
Grain, Individual Packs. Product must provide or approved equal
1 0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition - -
128 54 CASE 200/10z Meal Pattern Requirements Peterkin No Bid
Animal Crackers, Whole Grain, Individual Bake Crafters 526 US Foods $29.92
Packs. Product must provide 1 oz equivalent or aporoved equal
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern PP d
129 | 100 [ CASE [ 100/1.10z Requirements Kelloggs 7978348786 Peterkin $27.19 Alt

RECAP



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
PACK PRICE PER UNIT FOB
= QTY | UNIT SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
=
Annie's Bunny Grahams, Honey, Chocolate & | General Mills 600237000 US Foods $35.25
Chocolate Chip. Product must provide 1 0z or anproved equal
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal PP d - -
130 100 CASE |100/1.250z Pattern Requirements Peterkin No Bid
Juice, Fruitables, Gold Rush, 100% Juice. Apple & Eve 24025 US Foods $17.30
Product must prow_de 1/2 cup red(orangg . or approved equal Peterkin $21.28 Alt
vegetable per serving to meet Child Nutrition
131| 560 | CASE | 40/4.230Z |\teq| Pattern Requirements.
Au Jus Powder Mix, Instant Foothill Farms 077T-T0700
or approved equal US Foods No Bid
132 1 CASE | 12/80z Peterkin No Bid
NOBID
Oil, Canola, Gallon. Chef's Pride 58501CHP US Foods $79.58
or approved equal Peterkin $53.37 Alt
133 5 CASE | 3/gal
Spice, Onion Flakes, Chopped, Dehydrated. [Durkee 2004055 Peterkin $21.10
US Foods $21.37
134 10 EACH 3# Pacific Spice 26130
or approved equal

RECAP



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

Dry Food Products

AWARD IN BOLD BID #103-23
= QTY | UNIT I?SAI‘;: ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PEI;gEéLigi
=
Sugar, Brown, 2# bags C&H 404832 Peterkin $48.45
US Foods $66.57
135 5 CASE 16/2# or approved equal

RECAP



