
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

AWARD IN BOLD

Expendable Products

BID #108-23

RECAP

IT
E

M
 #

QTY UNIT
PACK 

SIZE
ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNIT FOB SOLDOTNA

Pactiv YP160C NO AWARD

or approved equal US Foods No Bid

Arctic Office $90.63 Alt

Peterkin Dist. $101.50 Alt

WCP Solutions $103.41 Alt

Pactiv YPDL24CNH NO AWARD

or approved equal US Foods No Bid

Arctic Office $40.76 Alt

Peterkin Dist. $60.85 Alt

WCP Solutions $113.04 Alt

Dart 8SJ20 WCP Solutions $96.75

Arctic Office $105.00

US Foods $116.17

or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $58.05 Alt

Pactiv YCI8-1160-0000 Arctic Office $85.46

US Foods $207.28

WCP Solutions $53.39

or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $101.29 Alt

Nutri-bon 3606 US Foods $38.17

Global PM-MPPSPKIT

Dixie MWSKPC WCP Solutions $38.02 Alt

or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $38.50 Alt

Arctic Office $23.32 Alt

700 ct

Parfait Cup, Plastic, 16 oz 

302 20 CASE 1,000 ct

Container, Foam, 8 oz, Squat.  

301 10 CASE 900 ct

Lids for Parfait Cup, Plastic, Dome Style Lid 

(No Hole). Lid must fit Pactiv Brand Parfait 

Cup #YP160C

300 15 CASE

303 10 CASE 500 ct

Container, Plastic, Hinged, Smart lock, 6", 

Small Container. KPBSD 15-9032

304 112 CASE 1,000 ct

Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight 

Plastic, Includes spork, napkin and straw in 

a cellophane wrap.
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Parfait Cup, Plastic, 16 oz Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX Arctic Office $52.94

WCP Solutions $56.12

US Foods $64.14

or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $82.00 Alt

Pan Saver 42002 Peterkin Dist. $54.36

Pan Saver 658128420028

Pan Pals 22-PL3418 WCP Solutions $107.31

or approved equal US Foods No Bid

Arctic Office No Bid

Boardwalk 7229 WCP Solutions $31.28 Alt

PrimeSource 75003838 US Foods $45.83 Alt

Empress EFF242 Peterkin Dist. $32.50 Alt

or approved equal Arctic Office $42.57 Alt

Pactiv #TH1-0022 WCP Solutions $132.11

or approved equal US Foods No Bid

Arctic Office No Bid

Peterkin Dist. No Bid

Biokleen B00095A Peterkin Dist. $48.50

WCP Solutions $85.20

or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid

US Foods No Bid

Trays, 5-Compartment, Foam Lunch Tray, 

9"x12"

305 80 CASE 500 ct

Pan Liners, Steam Pan, Full Size, 6" Deep, 

Ovenable, 34"x18". Fits Full Size Hotel Pan

306 40 BOX 50 ct

PVC Film Food Wrap, 24"x2000' Roll w/ 

cutter guard edge. 

Bowl, 22 oz Capacity, Foam

309 20

307 10 ROLL 24"x2000'

308 15

CASE

CASE 504

6/16oz

Produce Wash, Bio Active
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