KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Frozen Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD Bid #109-23
PRICE PER UNIT| PRICE PER UNIT
g QTY | UNIT |PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR FOB SOLDOTNA| FOB ANCHORAGE
=S
Hamburger Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Baked, Sliced. Franz 74329 Peterkin Dist. $4984
One bun must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to meet
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. Baker Boy 31014 US Foods $49.01
200 ( 300 | CASE | 120/20z or approved equal
Hoagie Rolls, 5", Whole Grain, Hinge Sliced. Each  [Eranz (Oven Fresh) 62852 US Foods $42.88
roll must provide 2.25 oz equivalent grains to meet — .
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal Peterkin Dist. No Bid
201 | 40 | CASE | 72/2.30z
Bread, White, Gluten-Free, Frozen Loaf, Sliced. UDI's (Conagra) 9899780901 US Foods $59.06
or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $75.90 Alt
202 5 CASE 6/240z
Hot DOg Bun, 51% Whole Grain, FU“y Baked and Baker Boy 31034 US Foods $5313
Sliced.
or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $75.90 Alt
203 | 40 | CASE | 144/1.50z
Beef Hot Dogs, 6", CN Labeled. Product Must Smithfield/Farmland 7024781096 |US Foods $39.14
Provide 2.00 oz meat/meat alternate to meet Child —
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. Made With Peterkin Dist. §52.31
204 | 80 | CASE 80ct  1100% USDA inspected cuts of Beef with no fillers or [or approved equal
extenders.
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Whole Grain Breaded Beef Finger, FuIIy Cooked, CN TySOI‘I (AP) 10000097886 US Foods $110.39
labeled. One Serving must provide 2 oz meat/meat — .
alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child ~ [°r @pproved equal Peterkin Dist, No Bid
205 | 50 | CASE | 500/.970z |Nutriion Meal Pattern Requirements.
Beef, Teriyaki Nugget, FU“y Cooked, CN Labeled. Tyson (AP) 10000013827 US Foods $99.84
One Serving must provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate —
to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin Dist. $144.80
206 42 CASE 100/2.8 0z or approved equa|
Beef Crumbles, FuIIy Cooked, 1/4 Inch Crumbles JTM 5868CE US Foods $13561
Advance Pierre Peterkin Dist. No Bid
207 | 50 | CASE 30# or approved equal
Turkey, Sliced, Oven Roasted, Reduced Sodium, Hormel 32232 US Foods $136.55
0.50z Slices.
or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $110.30 Alt
208 | 20 | CASE 6/2#
Ham, S”CGd, Smoked, Reduced Sodium, 0.50z Hormel 32225 US Foods $6643
Slices
or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $64.05 Alt
209 | 20 | CASE 6/2#
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Chicken, Tangerine, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully - {int, Food Solutions 72001 US Foods $244.17
Cooked, CN Labeled. One serving must provide 2 oz —
meat/meat alternate and 0.5 oz equivalent grains to Peterkin Dist. $256.57
210 | 48 | CASE | 176/3.90z |meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements or approved equal
Chicken, Breaded Strips, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully Tyson 703322-928 US Foods $132.01
Cooked, Made With Whole Muscle Chicken Strips, —
CN Labeled. One serving must provide 2 oz Peterkin Dist. $156.00
211 | 30 | CASE | 110/4.50z [meat/meat alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to  [or approved equal
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.
Popcorn Chicken, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully Goldkist 110452 US Foods $131.46
Cooked, CN Labeled. One serving must provide 2 0z —
meat/meat alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to Peterkin Dist. $142.10
212 | 48 | CASE | 108/4.30z |meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.  |or approved equal
Corn Pup Dogs, Chicken, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. |goster Farms 96086 US Foods $32.57
One serving must provide 2 0z meat/meat alternate —
and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Peterkin Dist. $34.95
213 | 130 | CASE 10#  |Meal Pattern Requirements. Tasty Brands 64010
or approved equal
BBQ Pork Rib Patty, Fully Cooked with BBQ Sauce,  |yson/Advance Pierre 3817 Peterkin Dist §132.13
CN Labeled. One serving must provide 2 oz
meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal |0 @Pproved equal US Foods $68.74 Alt
214 | 54 | CASE | 100/3.250z |Pattern Requirements.
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Pizzaboli, Cheese Calzone, Whole Grain, Bulk Pack. Tasty Brands 53201 US Foods $119.77
Product must provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 — .
0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal ~ [Or @Pproved equal Peterkin Dist, No Bid

215 | 56 | CASE | 96/50z |Pattern Requirements
Pizza, Tony's 4x6 Cheese Pizza, Whole Grain, CN Tony's 78697 US Foods $73.84
Labeled. Product must provide 2 0z meat/meat —
alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Peterkin Dist. $84.00

216 | 64 | CASE | 96/4.50z [Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal
Pizza, Breakfast Pizza, 51% Whole Grain, Turkey Tony's 63912 US Foods $75.08
Sausage, CN Labeled. Product must provide 1 0z —
meat/meat alternate and 1.5 oz equivalent grains to Peterkin Dist. $79.30

217 | 32 | CASE [ 128/3.310z |meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal
The Max Mozzarella Cheese Filled Breadsticks, 51% Conagra 7738712602 US Foods $93.36
Whole Grain, CN Labeled. One stick must provide 1 —
0z meat/meat alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to Peterkin Dist. $99.77

218 | 63 | CASE | 192/1.90z [meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.  |or approved equal
Grilled Cheese Sandwich, Whole Grain, Reduced Integrated #134000 US Foods $82.99
Sodium American Cheese & Mozzarella, IW, CN — .
Labeled. Product Must Provide 2 oz meat/meat or approved equal Peterkin Dist. No Bid

219 [ 80 | CASE | 72/4.190z |alternate and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements
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—
Spaghetti, Short-Cut, Whole Grain Marzetti 41308-31002 US Foods $48.07
or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $40.00 Alt
220 | 60 | CASE 20#
Muffin, Blueberry, 51% Whole Grain, Product must  [qgis Spunkmeyer 10143 US Foods $39.97
provide 1 0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition —
Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin Dist. $60.47
221 80 CASE 72/20z or approved equa|
Waffles, Blueberry FIavor, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. Bake Crafters 1591 Peterkin Dist. $6280 Alt
Product must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to meet
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. or approved equal US Foods §59.93 At
222 | 50 | CASE | 72/2.60z
Banana Chocolate Chunk Benefit Bar. Product must | ;g j snackfoods 40402 US Foods $31.21
provide 2 0z equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition —
Meal Pattern Requirements. Peterkin Dist. $36.43
223 120 CASE 48/2.50z or approved equa|
Super Slice Banana Bread, IW, 51% Whole Grain, Super Bakery 6071
CN Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz equivalent
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern or approved equal US Foods $57.37 Alt
224 | 42 | CASE | 70/3.40z |Requirements. Peterkin Dist. $59.45 Alt
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Cookie, Sugar Cookie, Reduced Fat, Whole Grain. J&J Snackfoods 14925 Peterkin Dist. $9735
Product must provide 1.25 oz equivalent grains to
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements or approved equal US Foods $77.76 Alt
225 | 40 | CASE [ 192/1.850z
Crinkle Cut Fries, Seasoned, Crispy, 1/2" Deep Mccain 1000007470 US Foods $81.70
Groove, Low Sodium —
Peterkin Dist. $84.80
226 60 CASE 6/5# or approved equa|
Tater Tots, Reduced Sodium Simplot 10071179004189 US Foods $40.52
Peterkin Dist. $77.80
227 | 144 | CASE 6/5# or approved equal
Vegetable, Winter MiX, Blend of Broccoli and Slmplot 10071179188070 US Foods 37.83
Cauliflower, 1QF
Peterkin Dist. $50.41
228 36 CASE 12124 or approved equa|
Cheese, Yellow American, Sliced, 50% Reduced Fat, Land O Lakes 46288 US Foods $11093
50% Reduced Sodium, Pasteurized Processed. One —
serving must provide 1 0z meat/meat alternate to Peterkin Dist. $124.78
229 | 10 | CASE 6/5#  |meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.  |or approved equal
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—
Cheese, Mozzarella, Shredded Land O Lakes 41698 US Foods $64.07
Peterkin Dist. $88.87
230 5 CASE 4/5# or approved equal
Parmesan Cheese, Grated Kraft/Heinz 10021000615688 US Foods 33.64
Peterkin Dist. $34.72
231 10 CASE 1/5# or approved equal
Butter, Unsalted, 1# Blocks Glenview Farms 4268644 US Foods $129.17
Peterkin Dist. $147.00
232 2 CASE 30/1# Columbia Valley 06327
or approved equal
Bacon, Pre-cooked slices, 100% real bacon, warm & Hormel 03729 US Foods $51.74
serve.
or approved equal Peterkin Dist. $50.25 Alt
233 | 10 | CASE | 300 Slices
Breaded Mozzarella Cheese Sticks, Reduced Rich's #65219 Peterkin Dist. $92.95
Sodium, Whole Grain, CN Labeled, 5 sticks must
provide 20z meat/ meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent US Foods $95.35
234 | 40 | CASE 8/3#  |grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern or approved equal
Requirements.




