
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT

AWARD IN BOLD

Expendable Products

Bid #119-23

RECAP

IT
E

M
 #

QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR
PRICE PER UNIT FOB 

SOLDOTNA

Solo P200N WCP Solutions $47.26

or approved equal US Foods $59.70 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $35.52 Alt

Solo PL200N WCP Solutions $41.79

or approved equal US Foods $67.12 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $36.75 Alt

Solo P400N WCP Solutions $76.51

US Foods $235.08

or approved equal US Foods $150.07 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $64.20 Alt

Solo P550N WCP Solutions $111.87

US Foods $159.74

or approved equal Arctic Office Pro. $69.32 Alt

Solo PL4N US Foods $60.56

WCP Solutions $80.14

or approved equal US Foods $87.51 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $48.05 Alt

300 10 CASE 2,500 ct

Cups, 2 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. 

302 24 CASE 2,500 ct

Cups, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only

301 10 CASE 2,500 ct

Lids, 2 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. 

Lid must fit Solo Brand 2 oz Cup #P200N

303 10 CASE 2,500 ct

Cups, 5.5 oz, Plastic, Translucent. 

304 20 CASE 2,500 ct

Lids, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. 

Lid must fit Solo Brand 4 oz cup #P400N
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Nutri-bon 3606 US Foods $27.15

Global PM-MPPSPKIT

Dixie MWSKPC

or approved equal WCP Solutions $38.36 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $23.32 Alt

Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX WCP Solutions $55.67

US Foods $61.12

or approved equal Arctic Office Pro. $33.45 Alt

Southern Champion 0409 US Foods $38.23

Boardwalk BWK30LAG050

or approved equal WCP Solutions $29.08 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $29.50 Alt

Southern Champion 0413 US Foods $43.76

Boardwalk BWK30LAG100

or approved equal WCP Solutions $45.39 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $36.23 Alt

Southern Champion 0417 US Foods $55.57

Boardwalk BWK30LAG200

or approved equal WCP Solutions $53.98 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $42.60 Alt

Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight Plastic, 

Includes spork, napkin and straw in a cellophane 

wrap.
305 168 CASE 1000 ct

Trays, 5-Compartment, Foam Lunch Tray, 9"x12"

306 80 CASE 500 ct

Trays, 1/2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. 

Trays, 1#, Food Tray w/ Sides.  

309 30

307 30 CASE 1000 ct

308 30

CASE

CASE 1000 ct

1000 ct

Trays, 2#, Food Tray w/ Sides.  
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Boardwalk 7204

Inteplast FSW1801

or approved equal US Foods $33.85 Alt

WCP Solutions $23.67 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $30.54 Alt

Boardwalk 7116

Handi-Foil HFA11807 WCP Solutions $92.05

or approved equal US Foods $104.28 Alt

Arctic Office Pro. $53.60 Alt

Dart 8SJ20 Arctic Office Pro. $93.03

WCP Solutions $98.58

US Foods $116.06

or approved equal

HandGard 303679979 US Foods $55.76

HandGard FB37RM (TuffGards)

or approved equal Arctic Office Pro. $34.34 Alt

WCP Solutions NO BID

Paterson 24051610000 WCP Solutions $71.57

US Foods $72.87

Prime Source 25QPL

GP L010

or approved equal Arctic Office Pro. $129.49 Alt

Pan Liners, Super Release, 16 3/8" x 24 3/8"

Bags, Bun Pan, Plastic, 27"x37", High Density 

Heat Resistant.

20 CASE 200 ct

30

310 10 ROLL 18"x2000'

313

314

311 10 ROLL

312 CASE

PVC Film Food Wrap, 18"x2000' Roll w/ cutter 

guard edge. 

CASE 1000 ct

20

Container, Foam, 8 oz., Squat

1000 ct

18"x1000'

Aluminum Foil, 18"x1000' Roll, Dispenser Box w/ 

Cutter Guard Edge. 
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Pan Saver 42002

Pan Saver 658128420028

Pan Pals 22-PL3418 US Foods $45.39

WCP Solutions $67.64

or approved equal Arctic Office Pro. NO BID

Ziplock 682258

Ziplock 94604 Arctic Office Pro. $28.08

WCP Solutions $49.31

or approved equal US Foods $32.00 Alt

Pactiv TH1-0022 NO AWARD

or approved equal US Foods NO BID

WCP Solutions NO BID

Arctic Office Pro. NO BID

Ziplock, Gallon, Freezer Bags

316

317

20 BOX 250 ct

315

15 CASE 504 ct

Bowl, 22 oz capacity, Foam

30 CASE 50 ct

Pan Liners, Steam Pan, Full size, 6" deep, 

ovenable, 34"x18". Fits Full Size Hotel Pan
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