Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #123-23 Recap - Technology Equipment
Award is in bold

Qty Description

234 each Dell Latitude 5430 XCTO Base
(210-BDGV)

640 each Dell Latitude 3330 XCTO
(210-BDP))

155 each Dell OptiPlex 5000 SFF XCTO
(210-BCRK)

587 each Dell Chromebook 3110
(210-BCGK)

21each  Charging Cart
Anywhere Cart AC-MINI-16

9 each Charging Cabinet
Anywhere Cart AC-PLUS

Dell UD22 Universal USB Dock
(210-BEXR)

57 each

* 5% local bidder preference
** Does not meet specifications

Best Buy

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

chw Dreadnought
Government Endeavors Inc.
$1,325.00 $1,440.53
$825.00 $888.75
$900.00 $977.96
$425.00 $360.75
$650.00 $999.84
$1,000.00 $1,720.91
$240.00 $243.78

GCSIT

Solutions

$835.00

$659.00

$583.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ODP Business

Solutions

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$913.63

$1,605.70

$254.57

PNCIT

$1,482.47

$935.55

$876.57

$382.62

$1,028.96

$1,574.24

$244.54 *

Tommy
TALLLC

$1,400.00

$865.00

$950.00

$350.00 **

$620.00

$1,333.33

$245.61



