
KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
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FOB SOLDOTNA
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FOB ANCHORAGE

Johanna

Ardmore 41381 Peterkin $36.20
Ardmore 41381 USFoods $45.78
or approved equal

Minh 69074 Peterkin $83.90
Minh 69074 USFoods $84.19
or approved equal

J&J Snackfoods 04915 Peterkin $98.55
or approved equal USFoods NO BID

Rich's 16317 Peterkin $59.10
Rich's 16317 USFoods $56.96
or approved equal

Bake Crafters 869 Peterkin NO BID
Bake Crafters 869 USFoods
or approved equalCASE 150/2.2oz

Croissants, Sliced, Fully Cooked, Whole Grain. One serving 
must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 12-1080)

Biscuit Sticks, Frozen. One serving must provide 1 oz 
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements. (KPBSD 12-1064)

40 CASE 384/1oz

96/4ozCASE

203 80 CASE 250/1.25oz

201 100 CASE 84/5.9oz

56204

Fried Rice, Whole Grain, Frozen, Made with brown rice, 
carrots, peas, corn and authentic Asian seasonings. 
(KPBSD 12-3040)

Juice, Apple, Frozen, Foil Top Cup, 4 oz liquid, 100% Juice 
(KPBSD 12-2717)

Cookie, Sugar Cookie, Reduced Fat, Whole Grain. Product 
must provide 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements (KPBSD 12-1109)

202

128200

$73.18                    
4-Pallet Minimum
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Baker Boy 31142 USFoods $53.98
Aunt Millies Peterkin $49.83
or approved equal

Baker Boy #20555 USFoods $70.81
or approved equal Peterkin NO BID

Franz 74329 Peterkin $51.00
Baker Boy 31014 USFoods $52.90
or approved equal

Baker Boy 31034 USFoods $58.88
or approved equal

FSPL 99828820 (alt) Peterkin $51.48

Don Pancho 79341.02205 USFoods $45.80
or approved equal

La Mexicana (alt) Peterkin $45.60

Mini Garlic Toast, 51% Whole Grain, Brown & Serve. One 
serving must provide 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child 
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 12-1086)

54

Dinner Rolls, Baked, Whole Grain, Uncut. Each roll must 
provide 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal 
Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 12-1085) 

CASE

96 CASE 192/1.34oz

208

Hot Dog Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Fully Baked and Sliced. 
(KPBSD 12-1095)

205

Hamburger Bun, 51% Whole Grain, Baked, Sliced. One bun 
must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 12-1090)

207 240 CASE 120/2oz

206

Flour Tortilla, Heat Pressed, Whole Grain, 10". (KPBSD 12-
7852)

80 CASE

276/1oz

209 120 CASE

144/1.5oz

12/12 ct
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Simplot 10071179027812 Peterkin $50.80
Simplot 10071179027812 USFoods $36.65
or approved equal

Simplot 10071179004189 Peterkin $76.42
Simplot 10071179004189 USFoods $53.65
or approved equal

Mccain 1000007470 Peterkin $81.00
Mccain 1000007470 USFoods $63.28
or approved equal

Simplot # 10071179185017 Peterkin $50.35
Simplot # 10071179185017 USFoods $43.28
or approved equal

Super Bakery 6071 Peterkin NO BID
Super Bakery 7501 (alt) USFoods $61.03

99 CASE

Sweet Potato Crinkle Cut Fries. (KPBSD 12-4055)

120 CASE 6/5#

CASE 12/2#

Vegetable: Cauliflower, Frozen IQF. 

72

84

81 CASE 6/5#

214

Tater Tots, Reduced Sodium. (KPBSD 12-4060)

211

213

CASE 70/3.4oz

Super Slice Banana Bread, IW, 51% Whole Grain, CN 
Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to 
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 
12-1070)

Crinkle Cut Fries, Seasoned, Crispy, 1/2" Deep Groove, 
Low Sodium. (KPBSD 12-4032)

210

212

6/2.5#
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Tony's 63912 Peterkin $80.25
Tony's 63912 USFoods $75.49
or approved equal

J&J Snackfoods 40402 Peterkin $35.00
J&J Snackfoods 40402 USFoods
or approved equal

Albies #842 Peterkin $55.56
Albies #842 USFoods
or approved equal

Super Bakery 7507 Peterkin NO BID
Super Bakery 7507 USFoods $53.75
or approved equal

Arlington Farms 53363-00001USFoods $53.75
or approved equal

Arlington Farms 48/2.4oz (alt) Peterkin $34.00

Bacon Breakfast Pocket, Product must provide 1 oz 
meat/meat Alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet 
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.

CASE

140 CASE 48/2.5oz

219 64 CASE 96/2.4oz

Pizza, Breakfast Pizza, 51% Whole Grain, Turkey Sausage, 
CN Labeled. Product must provide 1 oz meat/meat alternate 
and 1.5 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal 
Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-5015)  215 64

SnacknWaffles, Buttery Maple, individually wrapped

218 84 CASE 75/3.4oz

Super Slice, Super Lemon, IW, 51% Whole Grain, CN 
Labeled. Product must provide 2 oz equivalent grains to 
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.

217 120 CASE

Banana Chocolate Chunk Benefit Bar. Product must provide 
2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements.  (KPBSD 12-1091)

216

128/3.31oz

60/3oz

$30.88 4-Pallet 
Minimum

$51.51 3-Pallet 
Minimum
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Bake Crafters 1673 Peterkin NO BID
Bake Crafters 1673 USFoods
or approved equal

Super Bakery 7012 Peterkin NO BID
Super Bakery 7012 USFoods $57.51
or approved equal

Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 Peterkin $55.00
Otis Spunkmeyer 10143 USFoods $40.47
or approved equal

Land O Lakes 46288 Peterkin $119.50
Land O Lakes 46288 USFoods $100.63
or approved equal

Land O Lakes 41698 Peterkin $85.63
Land O Lakes 41698 USFoods $70.25
or approved equal

Muffin, Blueberry, 51% Whole Grain, Product must provide 
1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements.  (KPBSD 12-1068)

223 15 CASE 6/5#

Cheese, Yellow American, Sliced, 50% Reduced Fat, 50% 
Reduced Sodium, Pasteurized Processed. One serving 
must provide 1 oz meat/meat alternate to meet Child 
Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 11-0035)

144

CASE 4/5#

Cheese, Mozzarella, Shredded. (KPBSD 12-1096)

72/2oz222

CASE

221 84 CASE

224 15

60/3.2oz

Super Stik, Whole Grain, Twin Pack Dunklin Stik

72/2.4oz

81 CASE

Pancake Bites, WG, IW, Frozen. Product must provide 2 oz 
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements.

220
$55.82   4-Pallet 
Minimum
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Metro Deli 311195 Peterkin NO BID
Metro Deli 311195 USFoods $43.38
or approved equal

Hormel 32048 Peterkin $54.07
Roseli 1939199 (alt) USFoods $41.33
or approved equal

Tyson (AP) 10000097886 Peterkin NO BID
Tyson (AP) 10000097886 USFoods $129.01
or approved equal

Tyson 002154-0928 Peterkin $105.15
Tyson 002154-0928 USFoods $87.81
or approved equal

Tyson 070302-0928 Peterkin $156.37
Tyson 070302-0928 USFoods $128.72
or approved equal

CASE

229

228 80 CASE

226

CASE 6/1.5#

Cheese, Mozzarella, Sliced. (KPBSD 11-0038)

227

225 5

48 CASE 132/3.75oz

Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully Cooked, 
CN Labeled. One patty must provide 2 oz meat/meat 
alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-3016)

2/5#40

63 CASE 500/.97oz

Whole Grain Breaded Beef Finger, Fully Cooked, CN 
labeled. One Serving must provide 2 oz meat/meat 
alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 13-1013)

Pepperoni (Vac Pak). (KPBSD 13-9503)

150/3.29oz

Chicken Breast Patty, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully Cooked, 
CN Labeled. One patty must provide 2 oz meat/meat 
alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-3015)
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Tyson 703322-0928 Peterkin $154.00
Tyson 703322-0928 USFoods $137.82
or approved equal

Schwan 000000-60585 Peterkin $84.00
Schwan 000000-60585 USFoods $84.17
or approved equal

Conagra 77387126023 Peterkin $98.73
Conagra 77387126023 USFoods $83.08
or approved equal

Marzetti 10041308310023 Peterkin $54.89
or approved equal

53201 (alt) USFoods $54.99

Tasty Brands 53201 Peterkin NO BID
Tasty Brands 53201 USFoods $110.88
or approved equal

231 60 CASE 8/400pcs

Chicken and Vegetable Dumplings, Whole Wheat Wrapper, 
Frozen

233 60 CASE 20#

Spaghetti, Short-Cut, Whole Grain, Pre-Cooked, Frozen.  
(KPBSD 12-7702)

232 63 CASE 192/1.93oz

230 40 110/4.5oz

Chicken, Breaded Strips, Whole Grain Breaded, Fully 
Cooked, Made With Whole Muscle Chicken Strips, CN 
Labeled. One serving must provide 2 oz meat/meat 
alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-3006)

CASE

The Max Mozzarella Cheese Filled Breadsticks, 51% Whole 
Grain, CN Labeled. One stick must provide 1 oz meat/meat 
alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition 
Meal Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-2095)

234 112 CASE 96/5oz

Pizzaboli, Cheese Calzone, Whole Grain, Bulk Pack. 
Product must provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz 
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-5017)
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Albie's 860 Peterkin $62.96
Albie's 860 USFoods
or approved equal

Fernando's 5211 Peterkin $75.71
Fernando's 5211 USFoods $71.44
or approved equal

Smithfield/Farmland 7024781096Peterkin $54.00
Smithfield/Farmland 7024781096USFoods $42.20
or approved equal

Land o Lakes 43274 Peterkin $102.96
Land o Lakes 43274 USFoods $89.67
or approved equal

Foster Farms 96086 Peterkin $42.18
Foster Farms 96086 USFoods $38.23
Tasty Brands 64010

or approved equal

Taco Snack, Beef, WG, Bulk Pack, CN Labeled. Product 
must provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent 
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.  
(KPBSD 13-2008)

237 80 CASE 80 ct

Beef Hot Dogs, 6", CN Labeled. Product Must Provide 2.00 
oz meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements. Made With 100% USDA inspected cuts of 
Beef with no fillers or extenders.  (KPBSD 13-1050)

235 120 CASE 48/5oz

Enchilada Empanada, Chicken & Cheese, Whole Grain, 
Bulk Pack. Product must provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate 
and 2 oz equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal 
Pattern Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-2009)

$61.23   3-Pallet 
Minimum

238 63 CASE 6/5#

Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium, 
Whole Grain, CN Labeled. Product must provide 2.00 oz 
meat/meat alternate and 1 oz equivalent grains to meet 
Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.   (KPBSD 13-
5010)

239 260 CASE 10# 

Corn Pup Dogs, Chicken, Whole Grain, CN Labeled. One 
serving must provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz 
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern 
Requirements.  (KPBSD 13-3516)

236 160 CASE 60/5oz
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Integrated #134000 Peterkin NO BID
Integrated #134000 USFoods $83.48
or approved equal

Tasty Brands 10292 Peterkin NO BID
Tasty Brands 10292 USFoods $93.76
or approved equal242 54 CASE 48/3.98oz

Anytimers, Turkey Pepperoni & Cheese kit, WG. Must 
provide 2 oz meat/meat alternative and 2 oz grain to meet 
Child Nutrition portion requirements

240 80 CASE 72/4.19oz

Grilled Cheese Sandwich, Whole Grain, Reduced Sodium 
American Cheese & Mozzarella, IW, CN Labeled. Product 
Must Provide 2 oz meat/meat alternate and 2 oz equivalent 
grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements.  
(KPBSD 12-7855)
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