KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #105-24
= PRICE PER UNIT FOB
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
#
Cups, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. Solo P40ON ODP $145.59
(KPBSD 15-2257)
Solo P400N GENESIS $94.20
300 | 10 casE | 2500t Solo P40ON WCP $57.86
Pactiv YS400A (alt) USFoods $151.19
EMP EPC400 (alt) Arctic Office $63.15
PETERKIN NO BID
Cups, 5.5 oz, Plastic, Translucent. Solo Brand Only Solo P550N ODP $155.23
(KPBSD 15-2260)
Solo P550N GENESIS $110.60
301 10 casE | 2500t Solo P550N WCP $83.56
Pactiv 597531 (alt) USFoods $115.75
EMP EPC550 (alt) Arctic Office $68.20
PETERKIN NO BID
Lids, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. Lid must Solo PL4N ODP $35.50
fit Solo Brand 4 oz cup #P400N. (KPBSD 15-7018)
Solo PL4N GENESIS $60.33
s02| 20 CASE | 2500t Solo PL4N WCP $57.86
Pactiv YSLS3FR (alt) USFoods $88.24
EMP EPCLID3 (alt) Arctic Office $38.28
PETERKIN NO BID
Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight Plastic, Nutri-bon 3606 GENESIS $63.75
Includes spork, napkin and straw in a cellophane wrap. '
(KPBSD 15-9075) Prime 75002480 (alt) USFoods $30.15
Net Choice NC414021 (alt) |WCP $25.37
303| 56 CASE | 1,000 ct EMP E176015 (alt) Arctic Office $23.32
ODP NO BID
PETERKIN NO BID
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TrayS, 1/2#, FOOd Tray W/ SideS. (KPBSD 15'9150) Southern Champion 0409 GENESIS $4625
Southern Champion 0409  |USFoods $67.21
304 10 CASE 1,000 ct Boardwalk BWK30LAG050 |ODP $38.47
Nova NFT50 (alt) WCP $29.85
NVA NFT50 (alt) Arctic Office $35.00
PETERKIN NO BID
Trays, 2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. (KPBSD 15-9160) Southern Champion 0417 |GENESIS $151.50
Southern Champion 0417 |USFoods $58.68
305 10 CASE 1,000 ct Boardwalk BWK30LAG200 |ODP $52.55
Nova NFT200 (alt) WCP $42.59
NVA NFT200 (alt) Arctic Office $41.60
PETERKIN NO BID
Trays, 5-Compartment, Foam Lunch Tray, 9"x12". Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX ODP $43.74
(KPBSD 15-9201)
Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX GENESIS $52.50
306 80 CASE 500 ct Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX USFoods $61.57
Stalk Market AT009 (alt) |WCP $124.18
GEN 10500 (alt) Arctic Office $47.29
PETERKIN NO BID
Pan Liners, Steam Pan, Full Size, 6" Deep, Ovenable, Pan Saver 42002 GENESIS $63.00
34"x18". Fits Full Size Hotel Pan. (KPBSD 15-8010)
Pan Saver 42002 PETERKIN $62.45
Pan Saver 42002 USFoods $66.07
307 10 BOX 50 ct ELK PL3418 (alt) Arctic Office $102.79
ODP NO BID
WCP NO BID
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Ziploc, Gallon, Freezer Bags. (KPBSD 15-1105) Ziploc 682258 ODP $36.35
Ziploc 682258 GENESIS $51.95
Ziploc 682258 USFood 42.87
308 | 25 | BOX | 250ct e ooc $
RJS GRZIPGAL (alt) Avrctic Office $24.76
LK 1GALFR (alt) WCP $166.87
Freezer Ziplock (alt) PETERKIN $23.48
Valid: Sept. 1st, 2023 -> November 30th, 2023 3



