Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #107-24 Recap - Solid Waste Collection and Disposal
AWARD IS IN BOLD

Nikiski, Kenai, Soldotna, Sterling, Kasilof

Alaska Waste

Moore & Moore
Services

SITE AREA "A" # Units/Month Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1. Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard 8 $23.19 $185.52 NO BID

2. Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard 68 $30.46 $2,071.28 NO BID

3. Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster 4 $47.67 $190.68 NO BID

4, Dumpster Pickup, 4-yard Recycle 3 $28.01 $84.03 NO BID

5. Rental Fee, 4-yard Recycle 2 $47.67 $95.34 NO BID

6. Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 28 $38.95 $1,090.60 NO BID

7. Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 5 $60.40 $302.00 NO BID

8. Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard 1 $41.83 $41.83 NO BID

9. Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster 1 $79.01 $79.01 NO BID

10. Roll-off Box Pick-up, 30-yard 1 $346.34 $346.34 NO BID

11. Rental Fee, 30-yard Roll-off Box 1 $239.09 $239.09 NO BID

12. Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40-yard 8 $465.19  $3,721.52 NO BID
Total $ $8,447.24 $0.00

Moore & Moore
Cooper Landing, Moose Pass Alaska Waste Services

SITE AREA "B" # Units/Month Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price

1. Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard 2 $761.40 $1,522.80 NO BID

2. Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster 2 $59.31 $118.62 NO BID
Total $ $1,641.42 $0.00




Ninilchik, Anchor Point, Homer

SITE AREA "C"

1. Dumpster Pick-up, 2-yard

2. Rental Fee, 2-yard Dumpster
3. Dumpster Pick-up, 4-yard

4, Rental Fee, 4-yard Dumpster
5. Dumpster Pick-up, 6-yard

6. Rental Fee, 6-yard Dumpster
7. Dumpster Pick-up, 8-yard

8. Rental Fee, 8-yard Dumpster
9. Roll-off Box Pick-up, 40 yard
10. Rental Fee, Roll-off Box, 40 yard

Total §

# Units/Month

Moore & Moore

Alaska Waste Services
Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
$10.31 $82.48 $10.83 $86.64
$16.00 $32.00 $16.00 $32.00
$12.45 $12.45 $19.12 $19.12
$32.00 $32.00 $31.99 $31.99
$14.59 $466.88 $24.35 $779.20
$48.00 $336.00 $47.02 S$329.14
$50.19 $150.57 $56.23 $168.69
$50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00
$164.90 $494.70 $137.84 $413.52
$150.00 $150.00 $200.00 $200.00
$1,807.08 $2,110.30

Price to replace broken dumpster lids, upon request:

1. 2-yard Dumpster

2. 4-yard Dumpster

3. 6-yard Dumpster

4, 8-yard Dumpster

5. 30-yard Roll-off Box

6. 40-yard Roll-off Box

Alaska Waste

Unit Price

$168.81

$168.81

$168.81

$168.81

$337.62

$337.62

Moore & Moore

Services

Unit Price

$157.50

$183.75

$194.25

$262.50

$892.50

$892.50




Price to sanitize containers, upon request:

1. 2-yard Dumpster
2. 4-yard Dumpster
3. 6-yard Dumpster
4, 8-yard Dumpster
5. 30-yard Roll-off Box

6. 40-yard Roll-off Box

Alaska Waste

Unit Price

$40.00

$40.00

$40.00

$40.00

$75.00

$75.00

Moore & Moore
Services

Unit Price

$75.00

$75.00

$75.00

$75.00

$75.00

$75.00




