KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #119-24
E QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE;E[TO".JI_’::; FOB
#
Cups, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. Solo P400N WCP Solutions $55.62
Solo P400N ODP Business $57.75
300 ( 10 | CASE | 2,500 ct Emp EPC400 (alt) Arctic Office $59.00
Karat pfp400 (alt) Peterkin $49.00
Monogram 597530 (alt) USFoods $138.92
Container, Foam, 8 oz, Squat. Dart 8SJ20 Peterkin $55.00
Dart 8SJ20 WCP Solutions $74.37
301 | 10 | CASE | 1,000 ct Dart 85J20 Arctic Office $84.73
Dart 85J20 ODP Business $62.58
Monogram 901825 500ct (alt) |USFoods $29.77
Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight Plastic, Includes Emp E176015 (alt) Arctic Office $29.76
spork, napkin and straw in a cellophane wrap. .
Empress E176015 (alt) WCP Solutions $22.46
302 ( 56 | CASE | 1,000 ct Prime 75002480 1,000ct (alt) |USFoods $30.40
Nutri-Bon 3608 ODP Business $21.85
or approved equal Peterkin No Bid
Trays, 1/2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. Boardwalk BWK30LAG050  [ODP Business $36.89
Nova NFT50 (alt) Avrctic Office $30.20
303 | 20 | CASE [ 1,000 ct Nova NFT50 (alt) WCP Solutions $29.23
Monogram 1,000ct 375950 (allUSFoods $29.00
or approved equal Peterkin No Bid
Trays, 5-Compartment, Foam Lunch Tray, 9"x12". Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX USFoods $45.03
Pactiv YTHB0500SGBX ODP Business $45.85
304 | 40 | CASE | 500ct Genpak 10500 (alt) WCP Solutions $44.27
Genpak 10500 (alt) Arctic Office $49.15
Peterkin No Bid
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#
Pan Liners, Sheet Pan, Super Release, 16 3/8" x 24 3/8". Paterson 24051610000 USFoods $75.78
Paterson 24051610000 WCP Solutions $71.35
305 20 | CASE | 1,000 ct Primesource 25QPL ODP Business $59.02
NVA N491 (alt) Arctic Office $52.01
or approved equal NO AWARD
Pan Liners, Steam Pan, Full Size, 6" Deep, Ovenable, Pan Saver 42002 Peterkin $62.45
34"x18". Fits Full Size Hotel Pan.
Pan Saver 42002 USFoods $66.07
306 | 15 BOX 50 ct Pan Pals 22-PL3418 ODP Business $61.59
LK PL3418 (alt) 100ct WCP Solutions $96.50
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Ziplock, Sandwich Bags. Ziplock #1158369 ODP Business No Bid
Monogram 975537 250ct (alt) |USFoods $36.00
307 ( 10 BOX 145ct Arctic Office No Bid
WCP Solutions No Bid
NO AWARD
Bags, Paper 12# Duro #598798 ODP Business $32.28
Duro DU18412 (alt) 500ct WCP Solutions $36.92
308 | 10 | cAsE 250 ct Kraft spsos12k 1,000ct (alt)  |Peterkin $42.23
Monogram 724962 500ct (alt) |USFoods $34.00
Duro DU18412 (alt) 500ct Arctic Office $39.42
NO AWARD
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