KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #127-24
ﬁ Qry UNIT | PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PR'CnggouTm FOB
s
Ziplock, Sandwich Bags. (KPBSD 15-1104) Monogram 975528 (alt) 1,000t |USFoods $62.42
Ziplock #1158369 4/145ct Peterkin $19.00
300 8 CASE | 4/145ct Ziploc 70762 (alt) 500ct ODP Business $18.92
Arctic Office No Bid
NO AWARD
Ziploc, Gallon, Freezer Bags. (KPBSD 15-1105) Ziploc 682258 250ct USFoods $42.93
Ziploc 921279 (alt) 152ct Peterkin $24.50
301| 25 BOX 250 ct Ziploc 682258 250ct ODP Business $37.28
Ziploc 94604 Arctic Office No Bid
Bags, Bun Pan, Plastic, 27"x 37", High Density Heat Resistant. [ dGard 303679979 USFoods $56.44
(KPBSD 15-1119) HandGard 303679979 Peterkin $65.90
302 25 CASE [ 200 ct HandGard 303679979 ODP Business $67.69
HandGard FB37RM (TuffGards) Arctic Office No Bid
Paper Bowls, 12 0z. (KPBSD 15-1215) Monogram 373721 (alt) 1,000ct  |USFoods $74.06
Dixie S12C175MR5 (alt) 175ct Peterkin $14.70
03] 2 CASE | 4/M125ct Aspen 27011 (alt) 1,000ct Arctic Office $97.79
Dixie #SWB12WS 125ct ODP Business $16.56
or approved equal
Container, Foam, 8 oz, Squat. (KPBSD 15-1222) Monogram 901825 (alt) 500ct USFoods $29.23
WinCup F8 500ct Peterkin $54.00
304 10 CASE [ 1,000 ct Dart 8SJ20 1,000ct ODP Business $54.41
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
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KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #127-24
ﬁ QTY UNIT | PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE PER UNITFOB
2 SOLDOTNA
3*
Bowls, Plastic, Microwavable, 220z. (KPBSD 15-1230) TLC TL022 ODP Business $76.16
or approved equal USFoods No Bid
305 5 CASE | 300 ct Peterkin No Bid
Arctic Office No Bid
Caps, Paper Serving. (KPBSD 15-1310) Cellucap RC100WT USFoods No Bid
Cellucap RC100WT 1,000ct Peterkin $112.00
306 10 BOX 100 ct or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
ODP Business No Bid
Cups, 4 oz, Plastic, Translucent, Solo Brand Only. (KPBSD 15-|g,0 paooN ODP Business $50.21
2257
) or approved equal USFoods No Bid
307| 45 CASE | 2,500 ct Peterkin No Bid
Arctic Office No Bid
Aluminum Foil, 18"x1000' Roll, DiSpenser Box w/ Cutter Guard Monogram 760013 (alt) 18"x1000" USFoods $95.32
Edge. (KPBSD 15-3000)
Handi-Foil HFA11807 18"x1000' Peterkin $110.85
308 5 ROLL | 18"x1000' Boardwalk 7116 18"x1000' ODP Business $64.05
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Gloves, Plastic, Medium (KPBSD 15-4500) Monogram 752593 (alt) 10/100ea  |USFoods $45.44
Sunnycare 7802 (alt) 1,000ct Peterkin $27.95
309 20 BOX 1000 ct Primesource 75007130 1,000ct  |ODP Business $7.84
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Valid: June 1, 2024 -> August 31, 2024 2



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #127-24
ﬁ QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR PRICE gl_E[T Ol:'I'TIIX FOB
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Gloves, Plastic, Large (KPBSD 15-4501) Monogram 752593 (alt) 10/100ea  |USFoods $45.46
Sunnycare 7803 (alt) 1,000ct Peterkin $27.95
310 20 BOX [ 1000 ct Primesource 75007140 1,000ct  |ODP Business $7.84
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Gloves, Plastic, Small (KPBSD 15-4502) Sunnycare 7801 (alt) 1,000ct Peterkin $27.95
Primesource 75007120 1,000ct ODP Business $6.27
M| 20 BOX 1000 ct Primesource 75007120 USFoods No Bid
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Pan Liners, Sheet Pan, Super Release, 16 3/8" x 24 3/8". Monogram 901636 (alt) 1,000ct USFoods $79.01
(KPBSD 15-8000) Paper Pulp QPL1624 (alt) Peterkin $65.25
M2 75 CASE | 1,000 ct PrimeSource 25QPL 1,000ct ODP Business $53.69
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Pan Liners, Steam Pan, Full Size, 6" Deep, Ovenable, 34"x18". (o4 saver 42002 USFoods $66.07
Fits Full Size Hotel Pan. (KPBSD 15-8010)
Pan Saver 658128420028 Peterkin $50.70
313| 80 BOX 50 ct Pan Pals 22-PL3418 ODP Business $59.55
Pan Pals 22-PL3418 Arctic Office No Bid
Plastic Food Wrap, 12'x3000". (KPBSD 15-8200) Monogram 300667 (alt) 12'x2000' ~ [USFoods $15.67
Hnadi-Film (alt) 12"x2000' Peterkin $24.35
34| 5 ROLL | 12"x3000' GetReddi FSW1203 (alt) 12'x3000' |ODP Business $28.96
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
NO AWARD
Valid: June 1, 2024 -> August 31, 2024 3



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Expendable Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD BID #127-24
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%
Utensils, Spork School Kit, Medium Weight Plastic, Includes  [pyime 75002480 (alt) 1,000ct USFoods $30.48
spork, napkin and straw in a cellophane wrap. (KPBSD 15-
9075) D&W finepack PSKF-1,000ct (alt)  |Peterkin $70.45
315 168 | CASE | 1,000 ct EMP E176015 (alt) 1,000ct Arctic Office $21.02
Nutri-Bon 3606 1,000ct ODP Business $17.04
or approved equal
Trays, 1/2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. (KPBSD 15-9150) Monogram 375950 (alt) 4/250ea USFoods $28.65
Special Qual. Packing (alt) Peterkin $43.00
316| 60 CASE | 1,000 ct NOVA NFT50 (alt) 1,000ct Arctic Office $26.75
Southern Champion 0409 ODP Business $26.15
or approved equal
Trays, 1#, Food Tray w/ Sides. (KPBSD 15-9155) Monogram 375308 (alt) 4/250ea  |USFoods $31.57
Special Qual. Packing (alt) Peterkin $43.00
317| 50 CASE | 1,000 ct NOVA NFT100 (alt) 1,000ct Arctic Office $30.79
Southern Champion 0413 ODP Business $29.41
or approved equal
Trays, 2#, Food Tray w/ Sides. (KPBSD 15-9160) Monogram 375317 (alt) 4/250ea USFoods $36.41
Special Qual. Packing (alt) Peterkin $36.50
318| 36 CASE | 1,000 ct NOVA NFT200 (alt) 1,000ct Arctic Office $34.41
Southern Champion 0417 ODP Business $35.25
or approved equal
Trays, 5-Compartment, Foam Lunch Tray, 9"x12". (KPBSD 15-|p,ctiv YTHB0500SGBX USFoods $26.21
9201) Genpak 10500 (alt) 500ct Arctic Office $44.01
319 160 [ CASE | 500 ct Genpak 10500 (alt) 500ct ODP Business $38.92
Peterkin No Bid
Valid: June 1, 2024 -> August 31, 2024 4
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Utensils: Fork, Plastic Heavyweight. (KPBSD 15-9220) Monogram 765209 (alt) 1,000ct USFoods $55.26
SOLO 827263 500ct Peterkin $17.60
3201 30 CASE 500 ct Nutri-Bon 3560 (alt) 1,000ct ODP Business $28.57
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
Utensils: Spoon, Plastic Heavyweight. (KPBSD 15-9221) Monogram 642072 (alt) 1,000ea USFoods $41.44
SOLO SPPPOA087427 Peterkin $17.60
321 30 CASE | 500 ct Nutri-Bon 3562 (alt) 1,000ct ODP Business $28.57
or approved equal Arctic Office No Bid
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