Kenai Peninsula Borough School District
Bid #113-25 - Technology Equipment
Revised RECAP - Award is in bold

Price Per Unit (Includes Shipping)

Local bidder preference does not apply to purchases $25,000 or greater
*CHGCT36-1N Charge Cart (alt)
**Bretford brand (alt)
***Dell Chromebook 3120

QTyYy Description
GCSIT Mal d
North Tech [The Chariot| CDW Gov. |  0ODP , aforan
. Solutions, Dell Company
Group, Inc | Group Inc LLC Business
LLC Inc
193 each [Dell Latitude 5450 XCTO Laptop (only) $1,157.34 | $1,192.85 | $1,195.00 NO BID $939.00 NO BID $1,199.77
(210-BMPS)
261 each |Dell Latitude 3340 XCTO Laptop (only) $883.56 $897.00 $700.00 NO BID $649.00 NO BID $677.21
(210-BGCL)
189 each [Dell OptiPlex 7020 Desktop Computer (only] $792.25 $804.30 $645.00 NO BID $569.00 NO BID $721.77
(210-BKWK)
1,080 each [Dell Chromebook 3110 (only) $316.19 [$370.20*** $351.00 NO BID NO BID ([$279.00***| $377.21
(210-BCGK)
10 each Dell PowerEdge T560 Tower Server (only) NOBID | $6,539.82 NO BID NOBID | $5,567.00| NOBID [$19,777.21
(210-BGRL)
14 each Charging Cabinet (or approved equal) NO BID $637.00 | $457.00 | $548.62 NOBID | $746.49**| NO BID
(AC-COMP-16)
21 each Charging Cart (or approved equal) NOBID | $895.19* | $1,140.00 | $863.40* [ NOBID [51,158.82*% $977.21
(AC-PLUS)
125 each [Dell WD22TB4 Thunderbolt 4 Dock (only) $255.43 $265.55 $260.00 $240.36 $188.00 NO BID $177.21

(210-BDQH)




