
Kenai Peninsula Borough School District Local bidder preference does not apply to purchases $25,000 or greater
ITB #109-26 - Technology Equipment ¹Bretford Cube Mini TVCM20PAC-BP
RECAP - Award is in bold ²PT-VERT-GLIDE-24
Price Per Unit (Includes Shipping) ³Eaton Tripp Lite CSC16AC

⁴Aver Cart CHRGEB030

QTY Description

GCSIT 
Solutions, 

LLC

Virtucom, 
Inc.

Arcticom 
LLC

ODP 
Business 

Solutions, 
LLC

STS 
Education

North Tech 
Group INC

126 each Dell Pro 14 Plus PB14250 Laptop (only) $1,101.00 $1,525.65 $2,221.06 NO BID NO BID $2,012.33
(210-BPDR)

29 each Dell Pro 14 PC14250 Laptop (only) $738.00 $948.00 $1,332.68 NO BID NO BID $1,207.17
(210-BPBS)

70 each Dell Pro Slim QCS1250 Desktop (only) $786.00 $1,118.68 $1,281.75 NO BID NO BID $1,161.04
(210-BPQX)

1,396 each Dell Chromebook 11 CC11260 (only) NO BID $508.21 $578.26 NO BID NO BID $469.85 NO AWARD
(210-BSQY)

9 each Dell PowerEdge T560 Tower Server (only) $11,397.00 NO BID $16,022.49 NO BID NO BID $13,536.85
(210-BGRL)

15 each Charging Cabinet (or approved equal) NO BID $579.45 $750.48 $592.00³ $669.00 $614.71
(AC-COMP-16)

30 each Dell Pro Thunderbolt 4 Dock WD25TB4 (only) $255.00 NO BID $288.08 $293.00 $299.00 $279.30
(210-BTMR)

4 each Laptop Cart (or approved equal) NO BID $769.45⁴ $988.25 $848.00¹ $939.00² $391.18
(SCC-20P)


