KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Dry Food Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD ITB #112-26
PRICE PER UNIT FOB
- QTy UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
m
=
Apples, Sliced in Water, Canned, No Added Sugar. Monarch 161926 (a") 6/#10 USFoods $82.84
(KPBSD 11-2015) :
Acme 73723-01040-3* (alt) 6/#10 Peterkin $68.15
100 | 168 CASE 6/#10
Mixed Fruit Cocktail, Canned (KPBSD 11-2020) Monarch 541049 USFoods $69.27
Acme (alt) Peterkin $70.35
101 56 CASE 6/#10
Peaches, Diced, Light Syrup, Canned. (KPBSD 11- Del Monte 2002349 USFoods $91.90
2025
) Del Monte 2002349 Peterkin $87.23
102 56 CASE 6/#10
;’g;:s, Diced, Light Syrup, Canned. (KPBSD 11-  [monarch 548403 (alt) 6/#10 USFoods $66.81
) Del Monte 2002352 Peterkin $82.30
103 56 CASE 6/#10
Diced Mango in 100% Fruit Juice, Packed in 40z Dole 100-38900-00443-6 USFoods $23.88
Plastic Cups. (KPBSD 11-2040) :
Dole 100-38900-00443-6 Peterkin $25.63
104 | 1050 | CASE 36/40z
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=
Mandarin Orange Segments in Pear juice. Shelf Dole 100-38900-04208-7 USFoods $26.10
Stable, no sugar added. Provides 1/2 cup of fruitto _
meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Requirements, |2/ 100-38900-04208-7 Peterkin $29.80
105 | 1050 CASE 36/40z  |(11-2014)
Pineapple Tidbits, Canned. (KPBSD 11-4400) Dole 00553 USFoods $70.36
Acme 73723-70031-1** (alt) 6/#10 Peterkin $62.85
106 144 CASE 6/#10
Applesauce Cups, No Sugar Added, Shelf Stable.  |1,eq Top 4878 USFoods $31.72
(KPBSD 11-6650) -
Tree Top 4878 Peterkin $31.38
107 180 CASE 72/4.50z
Mini Fruit Bar, Apple + Cinnamon. Provides 1/2 cup That's It 10810090991341 USFoods $151.18
of fruit to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern ' .
Requirements. That's It 10810090991341 Peterkin NO BID
108 180 CASE | 300/0.80 oz NO AWARD
Milk, UHT Chocolate (Fat Free). (KPBSD 10-1080) Gossner 0-76850-09936 USFoods $20.72
Gossner 0-76850-09936 Peterkin $20.90
109 [ 840 CASE 27/80z
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=
Milk UHT 1%, White (KPBSD 10-1091) Gossner 7685009913 USFoods $20.20
Gossner 7685009913 Peterkin $20.80
110 120 CASE 27/80z
Mik, Powdered Nonfat Dry Instant Monarch 228490 6/5¢ USFoods $137.42
Peterkin NO BID
111 5 CASE 6/5#
Juice, Apple, 100% Juice, Shelf Stable. (KPBSD 10- Ocean spray 00720 USFoods $20.85
1081
) Ocean Spray 00720 Peterkin $21.71
112 200 CASE 48/40z
Juice, Fruitables, Gold Rush, 100% Juice. Product Apple & Eve 24025 USFoods $17.23
must provide 1/2 cup red/orange vegetable per ,
serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Apple & Eve 24025 Peterkin NOBID
13| 420 CASE | 40/4.230z |Requirements. (KPBSD 10-1083)
Water, Bottles, 16.9 oz Plastic Bottle (KPBSD 10- Thirster 767514 (alt) 24/16.90z USFoods $713
1088
) Kirkland Peterkin $8.99
114 192 CASE | 40/16.90z NO AWARD
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=
Potatoes, Instant, Dehydrated. (KPBSD 10-4800) Idahoan 29700003019 USFoods $65.01
ldahoan 29700003019 Peterkin NO BID
115 90 CASE | 12/28 oz
Beans, Baked, Maple, Canned. (KPBSD 11-1310) Bush's 1637 USFoods $6688
Bush's 1637 Peterkin NO BID
116 | 280 CASE | 6/117 0z
Black Beans, Canned, Low Sodium. (KPBSD 11- Bush's 1885 USFoods $6094
1315
) Bush's 1885 Peterkin $55.76
117 56 CASE 6/#10
Beans, Pinto, Canned. (KPBSD 11-1319) Bush's 1819 USFoods $61.29
Bush's 1819 Peterkin $56.61
118 56 CASE 6/#10
Kidney Beans, Canned, Low Sodium. (KPBSD 11- Bush's 1745 USFoods $59.00
1325
) Bush's 1745 Peterkin $55.20
119 56 CASE 6/#10
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=
Beans, Refried, Traditional, Canned. (KPBSD 11- Rosarita 4430010641 USFoods $6374
1327
) Peterkin NO BID
120 [ 280 CASE 6/#10
Garbanzo Bean, Low Sodium Bush's 10039400017018 USFoods $58.13
Bush's 10039400017018 Peterkin $56.90
121 56 CASE 6/#10
Corn, canned, low sodium. (KPBSD 11-1330) Del Monte 2004499 USFoods $69.89
Del Monte 2004499 Peterkin $64.15
122 56 CASE 6/#10
Green Bean, Low Sodium, Canned (KPBSD 11- - |seneca F003710003328 USFoods $57.13
1340
) Seneca F003710003328 Peterkin $55.30
123 | 112 CASE 6/#10
Tomato Paste, Canned. (KPBSD 11-6000) Roseli 170192 (alt) 6/#10 USFoods $55.73
Prime Terra (alt) Peterkin $55.90
124 56 CASE 6/#10
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=
Tomato, Sauce, Canned. (KPBSD 11-6010) Roseli 176900 (alt) 6/#10 USFoods $38.57
S&W #192118 Peterkin $41.26
125 56 CASE 6/#10
Tomatoes, Diced, Canned. (KPBSD 11-6125) Harvest Value 173719 (alt) 6/410 USFoods $35.64
Prime Terra (alt) Peterkin $36.10
126 56 CASE 6/#10
Cinnamon Graham Cracker Bears, Whole Grain, |8 J Snackfoods 056072 USFoods $41.39
Individual Packs. Product must provide 1 0z .
equivalent grains to meet Child Nutrition Meal J&J Snackfoods 056072 Peterkin NO BID
127 | 162 CASE | 200/10z |Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 10-0388)
Cereal, Ginnamon Toast Crunch, Bowlpak, General Mills 29444000 USFoods $35.89
Reduced Sugar. Product must provide 1 0z . :
equivalent grains per serving to meet Child Nutrition General Mills 29444000 Peterkin NOBID
128 [ 180 CASE | 96/10z |Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 10-1278)
Cereal, Cocoa Puffs, Whole Grain, Bowpak, General Mills 31888000 USFoods* $34.86
Reduced Sugar. Product must provide 1 oz ' _
equivalent grains per serving to meet Child Nutrition [ S€neral Mills 31888000 Peterkin NO BID
129 [ 180 CASE | 96/1.06 0z |Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 10-1280) *must order increments of 9
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=
Cereal, Honey Cheerios, Whole Grain, GF, General Mills 18447000 USFoods* $36.29
Bowlpak. Product must provide 1 0z equivalent ' _
grains per serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal General Mills 18447000 Peterkin NO BID
130 [ 180 CASE | 96/10z |Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 10-1284) *must order increments of 9
Cereal, Lucky Charms, Whole Grain, Bowlpak. | General Mills 31917000 USFoods $34.69
Product must provide 1 oz equivalent grains per . :
serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern General Mills 31917000 Peterkin NOBID
131 180 CASE 96/1 0z  [Requirements. (KPBSD 10-1274)
Cereal, Frosted Mini Wheats, Whole Grain, KeIIogg's 038000049965 USFoods $3771
Bowlpak. Product must provide 1 oz equivalent ' _
grains per serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Kellogg's 038000049965 Peterkin NO BID
132 90 CASE | 96/10z |Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 10-1292)
Cereal: Instant Oatmeal, Apple & Cinnamon. Quaker 0003000319734 USFoods $27.70
Product must provide 1 oz equivalent grains per .
serving to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Quaker 0003000319734 Peterkin NOBID
133 80 CASE | 24/1.51 0z |Requirements NO AWARD
Cereal: Bulk Granola (KPBSD 10-1295) General Mills 16000-37854000 USFoods $48.20
General Mills 16000-37854000 Peterkin NO BID
134 20 CASE 4/500z
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Ranch Dressing Mix, No MSG. (KPBSD 10-1672)  |Foothill Farms V402-46190 (alt) 25#  [USFoods $148.57
Foothill Farms V402-60190 10# Peterkin $73.00
135 6 EACH 10#
Gravy Mix, Instant, Beef, Low Sodium. (KPBSD 10- Diamond Crystal #57774 USFoods $15.25
2122
) Diamond Crystal #57774 Peterkin $44.50
136 20 CASE 8/140z
Gravy Mix, Instant, Chicken, Low Sodium. (KPBSD Diamond Crystal #57773 USFoods $2406
10-2125
) Diamond Crystal #57773 Peterkin NO BID
137 20 CASE 8/150z
Dressing Mix, Italian. (KPBSD 10-6470) Kraft/Heinz #10043000846060 USFoods $60.42
Kraft/Heinz #10043000846060 Peterkin NO BID
138 36 CASE | 12/7.60z
Syrup Cup, Portion Control, Low-Sugar, 1.50z. |\adeira 7160371396000 USFoods $20.19
(KPBSD 10-6541) - ,
Kraft/Heinz 7160371396000 Peterkin NO BID
139 200 CASE | 100/1.50z
Valid: June 1, 2026 -> April 30, 2027 ITB #112-26 8



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Dry Food Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD ITB #112-26
PRICE PER UNIT FOB
- QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
m
=
Marinara Sauce Portion Cups. Product must provide(rad Gold REDNA2ZC168* USFoods* $75.74
1/2 Cup Serving of Red/Orange Vegetable per _
2.50z to meet Child Nutrition Meal Pattern Red Gold REDNA2ZC168 Peterkin NOBID
140 | 172 CASE | 168/2.50z |Requirements. (KPBSD 10-6600) *56 cs minimum order
Ranch Dressing, Reduced Fat, Portion Control Ken's KE0041B3 USFoods $2430
Pouches. (KPBSD 10-6605) .
Ken's KE0041B3 Peterkin NO BID
141 80 CASE 60/1.50z
Dressing, Caesar Salad, plastic jug. (KPBSD 11- K raft #10021000705068 USFoods $84.19
0020
) Kraft #10021000705068 Peterkin NO BID
142 36 CASE 4/1gal
BBQ Sauce, GaIIon, Plastic JUg OnIy (KPBSD 11- Heinz 10013000539507 USFoods $6975
1000
) Heinz 10013000539507 Peterkin NO BID
143 36 CASE 4/1gal
Ketchup, Dispenser Pouch Pack, Low Sodium. Heinz 10013000515686 USFoods $41.10
(KPBSD 11-1010) _ :
Heinz 10013000515686 Peterkin NO BID
144 40 CASE 2/1.5gal
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=
Cheese Sauce, Cheddar. One serving must provide || and O Lakes 39940 USFoods $99.03
1 oz meat/meat alternate to meet Child Nutrition _
Meal Pattern Requirements. (KPBSD 11-1030)  [-and O Lakes 39940 Peterkin NOBID
145 80 CASE 6/1060z
Mayonnaise, Light, Packaged in plastic bucket. Kraft 00021000642212 USFoods $74_25
(KPBSD 11-1045) ) .
Signature 13832 Peterkin NO BID
146 60 TUB 30#
Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat, One gallon, Light Kraft 10021000643018 USFoods $53.81
Mayonnaise. (KPBSD 11-1060) .
Kraft 10021000643018 Peterkin NOBID
147 40 CASE 4/1gal
Ketchup, Portion Control Packets, Low Sodium. Heinz 10013000565001 USFoods $33_79
(KPBSD 11-1080) .
Red Gold REDYL9G Peterkin NO BID
148 168 CASE 1000/9¢
Mayonnaise, Portion Control, Reduced Fat, 129. | 4einz 10013000531709 (alt) 200/12g  [USFoods $25.76
(KPBSD 11-1090) : :
Heinz 10013000532058 Peterkin NOBID
149 100 CASE 200/12g
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=
Mustard, Portion Control, Yellow, Prepared. Kraft/Heinz 7160370539000 500/5.5g  |USFoods $14.55
(KPBSD 11-1096) -
French's 418539902 (alt) 500/7g Peterkin $14.20
150 200 CASE 500/5.5g
Soy Sauce, Low Sodium, Portion Control Packets. |kikkoman #00120 USFoods $12.59
(KPBSD 11-1100) , .
Kikkoman #00120 Peterkin $12.60
151 80 CASE 500/6ml
Pickles, Dill, Sliced, Crinkle CUt, Pouch Pack. Heinze 1013000658208 USFoods $6049
(KPBSD 11-1120) _ :
Heinze 1013000658208 Peterkin $69.35
152 40 CASE 6/5.75#
Salsa, Mild, Gallon, Plastic Jug Only. (KPBSD 11- Rosarita 4430010688 USFoods $79.70
1126
) Rosarita 4430010688 Peterkin $83.67
153 50 CASE 4/1gal
Sweet & Sour Sauce, Portion Control Packets. Schwan's 69737 USFoods $19.63
(KPBSD 11-1140) _
Schwan's 69737 Peterkin $20.40
154 80 CASE 250/11g
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H
Seasoning, Italian, Bulk. (KPBSD 10-1670) Pacific Spice 26355 USFoods $15.01
Pacific Spice 26355 Peterkin $18.87
155 10 CASE 1128 oz
Lemon Juice, Plastic Bottle. (KPBSD 10-2651) | rhirster 130819 (alt) 12/320z USFoods $40.54
Suntree 521 Peterkin NO BID
156 2 CASE 12/320z
Canola Oil. (KPBSD 10-3994) Chefs Pride 58501CHP (alt) 3/1gal  |USFoods $56.87
Kirkland 906410 Peterkin $19.90
157 | 15 CASE 2/3qt NO AWARD
Pan Coating Spray. (KPBSD 10-4000) Monarch 399289 (alt) 6/170z USFoods $23.46
Vegalene #17260 6/170z Peterkin $40.93
158 4 CASE 6/170z
Spice, Basil Leaves. (KPBSD 10-6431) Monarch 203845 1/5.50z USFoods $30.68
Pacific Spice 26255 1/60z Peterkin $3.50
159 2 CASE 6/40z Culinary Secret 2005163
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=
Spice: Chili Powder. (KPBSD 10-6436) Monarch 203859 (alt) 1/180z USFoods $7.29
Pacific Spice #CHILPWR112 1/160z Peterkin $8.65
160 6 CASE 6/180z
Spice: Cinnamon Ground. (KPBSD 10-6437) Monarch 203864 (alt) 1/180z USFoods $7.93
Pacific Spice CIG12I (alt) 1/160z Peterkin $8.06
161 10 EACH 15 0z
Spice: Cumin Powder. (KPBSD 10-6442) Monarch 207822 (alt) 1/160z USFoods $6.47
Pacific Spice #2100 1/160z Peterkin $7.86
162 4 CASE 6/160z
Spice: Garlic Powder. (KPBSD 10-6453) Monarch (alt) 1/210z USFoods $7.44
Pacific Spice #34197 1/160z Peterkin $7.64
163 6 CASE 6/210z
Spice, Marjoram. (KPBSD 10-6460) Monarch 203869 (alt) 1/100z USFoods $17.73
Pacific Spice #26489 1/50z Peterkin $3.70
164 | 1 CASE | 6/doz
Valid: June 1, 2026 -> April 30, 2027 ITB #112-26 13



KENAI PENINSULA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT Dry Food Products RECAP
AWARD IN BOLD ITB #112-26
PRICE PER UNIT FOB
- QTY UNIT PACK SIZE ITEM DESCRIPTION ACCEPTABLE BRANDS VENDOR SOLDOTNA
m
=
Mrs. Dash Seasoning. (KPBSD 10-6462) Mrs. Dash #J016-AY900 USFoods $36.04
Mrs. Dash #J016-AY900 Peterkin $38.08
165 12 CASE | 6/6.750z
Spice: Dry Mustard. (KPBSD 10-6463) Monarch (alt) 11150z USFoods $5.86
Coleman's #6780300080 1/160z Peterkin $12.85
166 5 EACH 160z
Spice, Onion Flakes, Chopped, Dehydrated. Durkee 2004055 1/3# USFoods $16.56
(KPBSD 10-6471) —— :
Pacific Spice 26130 1/3# Peterkin $21.50
167 30 CASE 3
Spice: Onion Powder. (KPBSD 10-6473) Monarch 207428 (alt) 200z USFoods $4.11
Culinary Origin #10972 Peterkin NO BID
168 5 EACH 200z
Spice, Oregano Leaves. (KPBSD 10-6476) Monarch 207192 1/50z USFoods $3.09
Pacific Spice 26315 1/50z Peterkin $5.48
169 1 CASE 6/50z Culinary origin
Valid: June 1, 2026 -> April 30, 2027 ITB #112-26 14
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=
Spice, Paprika. (KPBSD 10-6480) Monarch #208196 1/180z USFoods $6.52
Pacific Spice 26335 1/180z Peterkin $8.35
170 1 CASE 6/180z
Spice, Black Pepper, Ground. (KPBSD 10-6491)  Monarch 207215 1/180z USFoods $7.92
Pacific Spice 26190 1/160z Peterkin $10.71
171 3 CASE 6/16 oz
Spice: Salt, lodized. (KPBSD 10-6494) Monarch #200184 USFoods $46.32
Monarch #200184 Peterkin NO BID
172 2 CASE | 24/260z
Spice, Thyme Leaves. (KPBSD 10-6498) Monarch 207266 1/70z USFoods $5.36
Pacific Spice 26215 1/90z Peterkin $7.33
173 1 CASE 6/70z
Sugar, Brown, 2# bags. (KPBSD 10-6500) Monarch 170344 (alt) 12/2# USFoods $44.86
C&H 627347 (alt) 7# Peterkin $10.69
174 7 CASE 16/24
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=
Sugar, White, Granulated. (KPBSD 10-651 1) Monarch 229741 (alt) 25# USFoods $29.79
C&H 30625 10/4# Peterkin $64.13
175 1 CASE 10/4#
Vinegar, White. (KPBSD 10-8551) Monarch 252630 (alt) 4/1gal USFoods $33.68
Four Monks 444438 Peterkin $13.15
176 5 CASE 2/1gal NO AWARD
Vinegar, Red Wine Heinz 10013000008348 4/1gal USFoods $45.42
Heinz 520420 (alt) 4/1gal Peterkin $47.20
177 1 CASE 4/1gal
Yeast, Dry Active SAF 100013039 (alt) 20/1# USFoods $103.09
SAF 100013039 (alt) 1# USFoods $5.16
178 5 EACH 1# Fleischmanns 10754715021399 Peterkin $5.00
Flour, A“-PUI’pOSG, Unbleached, Enriched Monarch 9396509 USFoods $1823
Gold Medal Peterkin NO BID
179 5 BAG 254
Valid: June 1, 2026 -> April 30, 2027 ITB #112-26 16
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=
Flour, Whole Wheat, Unbleached Gold Medal USFoods $4906
Gold Medal Peterkin NO BID
180 5 BAG 50#
Quick Cooking Rolled Oats Bob's Red Mill P101243 USFoods $41.03
Bob's Red Mill P101243 Peterkin $43.90
181 60 BAG 25#
**Acme brand does not meet nutritional
requirements
ITB #112-26 17
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